
Municipality Product Volume Price per CY/Ton Price per CY/Ton Total Price per CY/Ton Total Price per CY/Ton Total TONLINO & SONS
Section 1 Delivered A. Colarusso & Son, Inc Northeast Paving Northeast Paving Trew Stone LLC Trew Stone LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Troy Sand & Gravel REJECTED NOT SEALED

 
Adams 3/4" Screened Gravel 400 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE  

1" Minus Crushed Gravel 400 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Washed Gravel 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $26.75 $2,675.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Washed Gravel 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $26.75 $2,675.00 NON RESPONSIVE $22.00 $2,200.00
1/2" Washed Gravel 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $26.75 $2,675.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $28.50 $5,700.00 $26.00 $5,200.00 $22.00 $4,400.00
1/2" Minus TRG (Traprock Gravel) 400 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $13,725.00 $5,200.00 $6,600.00
 

Cheshire 1 1/2" Crushed Gravel 500 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE $20.00 $10,000.00
 3/4" Washed Gravel Stone 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $25.50 $2,550.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
 3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 300 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $26.25 $7,875.00 $24.00 $7,200.00
 3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 300 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $26.75 $8,025.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $2,550.00 $15,900.00 $17,200.00
  
Egremont 1 1/2" Crushed Gravel 1000 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE $20.00 $20,000.00
 3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $31.50 $6,300.00 $24.00 $4,800.00

TOTAL BID $6,300.00 $24,800.00
   

Lanesborough 1" Minus Crushed Gravel (Type "d") 200 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Crushed Gravel 200 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
Relclaimed pavement( Hardpack) 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $15.75 $1,575.00 $18.00 $1,800.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $27.25 $5,450.00 $20.00 $4,000.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $27.25 $5,450.00 $20.00 $4,000.00
Rip Rap 6" Max 20 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
 TOTAL BID $1,575.00 $12,700.00 $8,000.00
 

Lenox 3/4" Washed Gravel Stone 50 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $21.00 $1,050.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/8" Washed Gravel Stone 25 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $21.00 $525.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $22.75 $2,275.00 $29.00 $2,900.00 NON RESPONSIVE
Rip Rap 6" Max 50 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $3,850.00 $2,900.00 $0.00

Mt. Washington 1 1/2 Crushed Gavel MDOT 1.03.1 1000 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1" Minus Crushed Gravel MDOT 1.03.1 1000 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/8" Washed Gravel Stone 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE 26.75 $2,675.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 1000 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $33.50 $33,500.00 NON RESPONSIVE
3/4 Crushed Stone (traprock) 1000 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $33.50 $33,500.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1/2 " Crushed Stone (traprock) 250 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $34.50 $8,625.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $28.50 $5,700.00 $32.75 $6,550.00 NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 2000 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $28.50 $57,000.00 $27.75 $55,500.00 NON RESPONSIVE
Modified Rockfill 100 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $42.50 $4,250.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $65,375.00 $141,925.00 $0.00

New Ashford Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $15.25 $3,050.00 $20.00 $4,000.00 NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone 40 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $24.25 $970.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
Dumped Rip Rap 40 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $33.25 $1,330.00 NON RESPONSIVE
 TOTAL BID  $4,020.00 $5,330.00 $0.00
 

New Marlborough Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $16.50 $3,300.00 $23.75 $4,750.00 NON RESPONSIVE
TOTAL BID  $3,300.00 $4,750.00 $0.00

Otis 1 1/2 Unwashed Gravel Stone 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 300 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $29.50 $8,850.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1  1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 300 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $25.00 $7,500.00 $29.50 $8,850.00 $18.00 $5,400.00
Rip Rap 6" max 15 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE $24.00 $360.00
 TOTAL BID  $7,500.00 $17,700.00 $5,760.00

Peru 3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $26.25 $5,250.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 500 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $27.25 $13,625.00 $26.00 $13,000.00 NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 500 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $27.25 $13,625.00 $21.25 $10,625.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID  $27,250.00 $28,875.00 $0.00

Pittsfield Loam 50 CY NON RESPONSIVE No Bid NON RESPONSIVE $20.00 $1,000.00
TOTAL BID  $0.00 $0.00 $1,000.00

Richmond Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) 200 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $14.00 $2,800.00 $20.00 $4,000.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 500 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $30.50 $15,250.00 NON RESPONSIVE
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 500 Tons NON RESPONSIVE No Bid $29.75 $14,875.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 2000 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $24.75 $49,500.00 $29.00 $58,000.00 $20.00 $40,000.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 2000 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $24.75 $49,500.00 $24.00 $48,000.00 $20.00 $40,000.00

TOTAL BID  $101,800.00 $140,125.00 $80,000.00

Tyringham 1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 600 Tons NON RESPONSIVE $24.75 $14,850.00 $29.00 $17,400.00 $18.00 $10,800.00
TOTAL BID  $14,850.00 $17,400.00 $17,400.00 $10,800.00

TOTAL EXTENSIONS PICKED UP PRODUCT $245,795.00 $399,105.00 $154,160.00
1.5% Admin Fee $3,686.93 $5,986.58 $2,312.40

Highlighted = lowest price



BRGPP Bid Results
FY21-01 Aggregates & Loam
Tuesday July 7th 2020

Bidder
Tax Compliance 
Form

Non 
Collusion 
Form

Product 
Certificate Form Plant Location on Section 1 Pricing 2nd plant

A. Colarusso & Son, Inc Yes Yes Yes 91 Newman Rd, Hudson, NY  
Northeast Paving Yes Yes Yes 30 Willow Hill Road, Lee, MA 
Trew Stone LLC Yes Yes Yes 901 River Rd, Deerfield, MA
Troy Sand & Gravel Co Inc Yes Yes Yes 33 Palitsch Road, Brunswick, NY

Note: For the bid pricing on the various items please see the enclosed a copy of the bid sheets

Official Bid Summary Results July 9th General Notes: Condron, Europvia and Trew Stone did not have all Communities
 
 



Municipality Product Volume Price per CY/Ton Total Price per CY/Ton Total Price per CY/Ton Total Price per CY/Ton Total TONLINO & SONS
Section 1 Picked up A. Colarusso & Son, Inc A. Colarusso & Son, Inc Northeast Paving Northeast Paving Trew Stone LLC Trew Stone LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Troy Sand & Gravel REJECTED NOT SEALED

Becket 3/4 Crushed Stone (Traprock) 700 Tons $13.00 $9,100.00 No Bid $15.00 $10,500.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 1000 Tons $10.00 $10,000.00 $19.75 $19,750.00 $15.75 $15,750.00 NON RESPONSIVE  
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 800 Tons $10.00 $8,000.00 $19.75 $15,800.00 $10.85 $8,680.00 NON RESPONSIVE
Rip Rap 6" Max 200 Tons $13.00 $2,600.00 No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
Dumped Rip Rap 100 Tons No Bid No Bid $15.75 $1,575.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID  $29,700.00 $35,550.00 $36,505.00
 

Lee 3/4" Screened Gravel(MDOT 1.03.0) 100 CY $10.00 $1,000.00 No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
Loam 100 CY No Bid No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/4 Washed Gravel Stone 75 Tons $10.00 $750.00 $18.00 $1,350.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
Rip Rap 6" Max 30 Tons $13.00 $390.00 No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $2,140.00 $1,350.00

Lenox 1 1/2" Minus Screened Gravel Type "d" 740 CY $10.00 $7,400.00 No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone 50 Tons $10.00 $500.00 $18.00 $900.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/8 Washed Gravel Stone 25 Tons $10.00 $250.00 $18.00 $450.00 NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2 Dense Graded Crushed Stone 100 Tons $10.00 $1,000.00 $19.75 $1,975.00 $15.75 $1,575.00 NON RESPONSIVE
Rip Rap 6" Max 50 Tons $13.00 $650.00 No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $9,800.00 $3,325.00 $1,575.00

Mt. Washingto 3/8 Washed Gravel Stone 50 Tons $10.00 $500.00 No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
1 1/2 inch Crushed Stone (Traprock) 50 Tons $13.00 $650.00 No Bid $15.00 $750.00 NON RESPONSIVE
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 50 Tons $13.00 $650.00 No Bid $15.00 $750.00 NON RESPONSIVE
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 50 Tons $13.00 $650.00 No Bid $16.00 $800.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $2,450.00 $0.00 $2,300.00

Otis 1 1/2 Gravel Stone 100 Tons No Bid No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/4 Crushed Stone (Traprock) 200 Tons $13.00 $2,600.00 No Bid $15.00 $3,000.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $2,600.00 $0.00 $3,000.00

Pittsfield Loam 50 CY No Bid No Bid NON RESPONSIVE $20.00 $1,000.00
TOTAL BID $0.00 $1,000.00

Stockbridge 1" Minus Crushed Gravel (MDOT 1.03.1) 1500 CY No Bid No Bid NON RESPONSIVE NON RESPONSIVE
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 1000 Tons $13.00 $13,000.00 No Bid $15.75 $15,750.00 NON RESPONSIVE

TOTAL BID $13,000.00 $0.00 $15,750.00

Tyringham 1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) 50 Tons $13.00 $650.00 No Bid $15.00 $750.00 $22.00 $1,100.00
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone 1200 Tons $10.00 $12,000.00 $19.75 $23,700.00 $15.75 $18,900.00 $18.00 $21,600.00

TOTAL BID $12,650.00 $23,700.00 $19,650.00 $22,700.00

TOTAL EXTENSIONS PICKED UP PRODUCT $72,340.00 $63,925.00 $42,275.00 $22,700.00
1.5% Admin Fee $958.88 $1,177.20 $634.13 $340.50

Highlighted = lowest price
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