
FY22-01 Aggregates & Loam

Bidder Bid Signature Form Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form
Century Aggregates, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Yes Yes Yes Yes
John S. Lane & Son Yes Yes Yes Yes
Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes
Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 100.00                                         No Bid No Bid 22.50$                                                                                       2,250.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 160.00                                         No Bid No Bid 30.00$                                                                                       4,800.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,090.00                                     No Bid No Bid 22.50$                                                                                       24,525.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,750.00                                     No Bid No Bid 22.50$                                                                                       39,375.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 125.00                                         No Bid No Bid 16.00$                                                                                       2,000.00$     13.05$                        1,631.25$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 2,525.00                                     No Bid No Bid 29.00$                                                                                       73,225.00$   15.35$                        38,758.75$   15.45$                  39,011.25$   No Bid No Bid
1/2" Curhsed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,200.00                                     No Bid No Bid 29.00$                                                                                       34,800.00$   14.95$                        17,940.00$   16.00$                  19,200.00$   No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 700.00                                         No Bid No Bid 29.00$                                                                                       20,300.00$   14.65$                        10,255.00$   15.00$                  10,500.00$   No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 100.00                                         No Bid No Bid 29.00$                                                                                       2,900.00$     14.35$                        1,435.00$     15.00$                  1,500.00$     No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,800.00                                     No Bid No Bid 18.00$                                                                                       32,400.00$   17.10$                        30,780.00$   10.85$                  19,530.00$   No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,800.00                                     No Bid No Bid 18.00$                                                                                       32,400.00$   14.15$                        25,470.00$   15.75$                  28,350.00$   No Bid No Bid
1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Tons 500.00                                         No Bid No Bid 29.00$                                                                                       14,500.00$   11.50$                        5,750.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 360.00                                         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.35$                        5,886.00$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dumped Rip Rap Tons 100.00                                         No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 19.95$                        1,995.00$     15.75$                  1,575.00$     No Bid No Bid

Section 1: Picked Up Aggregates
Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast PavingProduct Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. John S. Lane & Son Trew Stone, LLC



Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 400.00                          No Bid No Bid 37.50$                                     15,000.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 400.00                          No Bid No Bid 37.50$                                     15,000.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Tons 100.00                          No Bid No Bid 18.00$                                     1,800.00$                                No Bid No Bid 18.50$                 1,850.00$           No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 200.00                          No Bid No Bid 26.00$                                     5,200.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 100.00                          No Bid No Bid 26.00$                                     2,600.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 600.00                          No Bid No Bid 39.00$                                     23,400.00$                              No Bid No Bid 28.00$                 16,800.00$         No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 500.00                          No Bid No Bid 39.00$                                     19,500.00$                              No Bid No Bid 27.75$                 13,875.00$         22.00$                 11,000.00$         
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 300.00                          No Bid No Bid 39.00$                                     11,700.00$                              No Bid No Bid 27.75$                 8,325.00$           No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 400.00                          No Bid No Bid 28.00$                                     11,200.00$                              No Bid No Bid 22.50$                 9,000.00$           No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 200.00                          No Bid No Bid 28.00$                                     5,600.00$                                No Bid No Bid 27.50$                 5,500.00$           22.00$                 4,400.00$           
Dumped Rip Rap Tons 40.00                             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.00$                 1,280.00$           No Bid No Bid

Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 1,000.00                       No Bid No Bid 34.50$                                     34,500.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 200.00                          No Bid No Bid 42.00$                                     8,400.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 100.00                          No Bid No Bid 34.50$                                     3,450.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Tons 200.00                          No Bid No Bid 16.00$                                     3,200.00$                                No Bid No Bid 23.00$                 4,600.00$           No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 50.00                             No Bid No Bid 24.00$                                     1,200.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.00$                 1,200.00$           
1 1/2" Unwashed  Gravel Stone Tons 200.00                          No Bid No Bid 24.00$                                     4,800.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 525.00                          No Bid No Bid 37.00$                                     19,425.00$                              No Bid No Bid 33.00$                 17,325.00$         No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 500.00                          24.00$                 12,000.00$         37.00$                                     18,500.00$                              No Bid No Bid 33.50$                 16,750.00$         No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,900.00                       30.00$                 57,000.00$         37.00$                                     70,300.00$                              No Bid No Bid 32.75$                 62,225.00$         No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,294.00                       30.00$                 38,820.00$         37.00$                                     47,878.00$                              No Bid No Bid 32.75$                 42,378.50$         24.00$                 31,056.00$         
3/4" Dense Graded C rushed Stone Tons 2,500.00                       28.00$                 70,000.00$         26.00$                                     65,000.00$                              No Bid No Bid 27.25$                 68,125.00$         No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 2,400.00                       No Bid No Bid 26.00$                                     62,400.00$                              No Bid No Bid 32.00$                 76,800.00$         24.00$                 57,600.00$         
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 84.00                             No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 100.00                          No Bid No Bid 33.00$                                     3,300.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 2,025.00                       No Bid No Bid 33.00$                                     66,825.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,025.00                       No Bid No Bid 33.00$                                     33,825.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 250.00                          No Bid No Bid 23.00$                                     5,750.00$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 600.00                          22.00$                 13,200.00$         36.00$                                     21,600.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 800.00                          22.00$                 17,600.00$         36.00$                                     28,800.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,950.00                       22.00$                 42,900.00$         36.00$                                     70,200.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 2,050.00                       22.00$                 45,100.00$         36.00$                                     73,800.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 500.00                          22.00$                 11,000.00$         25.00$                                     12,500.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 1/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 700.00                          22.00$                 15,400.00$         25.00$                                     17,500.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Tons 500.00                          No Bid No Bid 36.00$                                     18,000.00$                              No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 200.00                          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Dumped Rip Rap Tons 200.00                          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.

Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.

Section 2c: Delivered Products - South County

Product Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving John S. Lane & Son Trew Stone, LLC

Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.
Section 2a: Delivered Bids - North County

Section 2b: Delivered Products - Central County

Product Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving John S. Lane & Son

Product Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving John S. Lane & Son



FY22-02 Cold Patch

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form
Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes
Eurvia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes
Ondrick Natural Earth, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Value
Trew Stone, LLC duraPatch 225 119.75$                           26,943.75$                   
Eurvia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving QPR 225 115.00$                           25,875.00$                   
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. No Bid 225 No Bid No Bid
Ondrick Natural Earth, LLC EZ Street 225 110.00$                           24,750.00$                   

Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
Trew Stone, LLC No Bid 5 No Bid No Bid
Eurvia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving No Bid 5 No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 5 400.00$                           2,000.00$                     
Ondrick Natural Earth, LLC EZ Street 5 975.00$                           4,875.00$                     

Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
Trew Stone, LLC No Bid 5 No Bid No Bid
Eurvia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving No Bid 5 No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 5 400.00$                           2,000.00$                     
Ondrick Natural Earth, LLC EZ Street 5 975.00$                           4,875.00$                     

Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
Trew Stone, LLC No Bid 16 No Bid No Bid
Eurvia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving No Bid 16 No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 16 400.00$                           6,400.00$                     
Ondrick Natural Earth, LLC EZ Street 16 975.00$                           15,600.00$                   

Section 1: Picked Up Products

Section 2a: Delivered Product - North County

Section 2b: Delivered Product - Central County

Section 2c: Delivered Product - Central County



FY22-03 Calcium & Magnesium Chloride

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form
The Gorman Group, LLC Yes Yes Yes
All States Construction, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes

Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Magnesium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price Bid Value
The Gorman Group, LLC 9,000.00                                                             1.00$                                   9,000.00$                        -                                                                               NA NA -                                                                    NA NA
All States Construction, Inc. 9,000.00                                                             1.10$                                   9,900.00$                        -                                                                               NA NA -                                                                    NA NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 9,000.00                                                             1.00$                                   9,000.00$                        -                                                                               NA NA -                                                                    NA NA

Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Magnesium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price Bid Value
The Gorman Group, LLC -                                                                       NA NA 2,000.00                                                                     No Bid No Bid 20,000.00                                                        No Bid No Bid
All States Construction, Inc. -                                                                       NA NA 2,000.00                                                                     No Bid No Bid 20,000.00                                                        No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. -                                                                       NA NA 2,000.00                                                                     0.95$         1,900.00$    20,000.00                                                        No Bid No Bid

Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Magnesium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price Bid Value
The Gorman Group, LLC 10,500.00                                                           1.05$                                   11,025.00$                      27,200.00                                                                   0.95$         25,840.00$  1,000.00                                                          No Bid No Bid
All States Construction, Inc. 10,500.00                                                           1.10$                                   11,550.00$                      27,200.00                                                                   No Bid No Bid 1,000.00                                                          No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,500.00                                                           1.00$                                   10,500.00$                      27,200.00                                                                   0.95$         25,840.00$  1,000.00                                                          No Bid No Bid

Bidder Estimated Bags - North County Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Bags - Central County Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Bags - South County Bid Price Bid Value
The Gorman Group, LLC -                                                                       NA NA 50.00                                                                           No Bid No Bid 100.00                                                              No Bid No Bid
All States Construction, Inc. -                                                                       NA NA 50.00                                                                           No Bid No Bid 100.00                                                              No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. -                                                                       NA NA 50.00                                                                           No Bid No Bid 100.00                                                              No Bid No Bid

Section 1a: Delivered as a Liquid - North County

Section 1b: Delivered as a Liquid - Central County

Section 1c: Delivered as a Liquid - South County

Section 2: Products Delivered in 50lbs. Bags



FY22-04 Culvert Piping

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form
EJ Prescott, Inc. Yes Yes Yes

Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
12" Solid 120.00                                                  8.95$                               1,074.00$                     15" Solid 160.00                                                  11.50$        1,840.00$     
15" Solid 240.00                                                  11.50$                             2,760.00$                     18" Solid 640.00                                                  17.25$        11,040.00$  
18" Solid 60.00                                                     17.25$                             1,035.00$                     24" Solid 200.00                                                  26.05$        5,210.00$     
24" Solid 60.00                                                     26.05$                             1,563.00$                     
36" Solid 40.00                                                     51.95$                             2,078.00$                     
48" Solid 80.00                                                     82.25$                             6,580.00$                     

Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
12" Solid 300.00                                                  8.95$                               2,685.00$                     12" Split 3.00                                                       13.00$        39.00$          
12" Perforated 40.00                                                     8.95$                               358.00$                        12" Watertight 3.00                                                       102.00$      306.00$        
15" Solid 1,150.00                                               11.50$                             13,225.00$                   15" Split 3.00                                                       21.00$        63.00$          
15" Perforated 40.00                                                     11.50$                             460.00$                        15" Watertight 6.00                                                       150.00$      900.00$        
18" Solid 1,100.00                                               17.25$                             18,975.00$                   18" Split 3.00                                                       35.00$        105.00$        
24" Solid 300.00                                                  26.05$                             7,815.00$                     18" Watertight 3.00                                                       248.00$      744.00$        

24" Split 3.00                                                       50.00$        150.00$        
24" Watertight 3.00                                                       375.00$      1,125.00$     
36" Watertight 2.00                                                       1,150.00$  2,300.00$     
48" Watertight 2.00                                                       1,850.00$  3,700.00$     

Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
15" Split 2.00                                                       21.00$                             42.00$                          12" Split 2.00                                                       13.00$        26.00$          
18" Split 1.00                                                       35.00$                             35.00$                          15" Split 17.00                                                     21.00$        357.00$        

15" Watertight 6.00                                                       150.00$      900.00$        
18" Split 5.00                                                       35.00$        175.00$        
24" Split 5.00                                                       50.00$        250.00$        

Section 1b: Double Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - Central County

Product Estimated Feet of Piping
EJ Prescott, Inc.

Section 1c: Double Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - South County

Section 2b: Double Wall Couplings - Central County

Product  Estimated Number of Couplings 
EJ Prescott, Inc.

Section 2c: Double Wall Couplings - South County

Product  Estimated Number of Couplings 
EJ Prescott, Inc.

Product Estimated Feet of Piping
EJ Prescott, Inc.

Section 2a: Double Wall Couplings - North County

Product  Estimated Number of Couplings 
EJ Prescott, Inc.

EJ Prescott, Inc.
Estimated Feet of PipingProduct

Section 1a: Double Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - North County



FY22-06 Guardrail Installed

Bidder Bid Signature Form Tax Compliance Form Non Collusion Form Debarment Form OSHA Form Mass Prequal Bid Bond
Guardrail Solutions, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Premier Fence, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Product Estimated Quanity Bid Price Total Bid Bid Price Total Bid
Standard Steel guard Straight w/ steel posts per ft 1,648 $32.40 $53,395.20 $31.90 $52,571.20
Standard Steel guard Curved w/ steel posts per ft 175 $38.55 $6,746.25 $32.00 $5,600.00
Standard Steel Straight w/ Wooden posts per ft 200 $42.20 $8,440.00 $35.00 $7,000.00
Standard Steel Curved w/ Wooden posts per ft 200 $45.00 $9,000.00 $35.00 $7,000.00
Standard Steel Terminal Ends (ea) 30 $200.00 $6,000.00 $75.00 $2,250.00
620.12 - Guardrail, TL-2 Single-Faced per ft 7,000 $28.00 $196,000.00 $26.15 $183,050.00
620.32 Guardrail, Curved, TL-2 Single-Faced per ft 450 $33.55 $15,097.50 $28.50 $12,825.00
627.82 - Guardrail Tangent End Treatment (#) 12 $5,230.70 $62,768.40 $3,300.00 $39,600.00
627.92 Guardrail Flared End Treatment - TL-2 (#) 14 $5,595.00 $78,330.00 $3,500.00 $49,000.00
Total Bid $435,777.35 $358,896.20

Guardrail Solutions, LLCPremier Fence, LLC



FY22-07 Line Painting

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form OSHA Form Debarment Form Mass Prequal Bid Bond Addendum 1
K5 Corporation Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Markings, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
Thermoplastic 4" White 40,000.00                  0.450$                            18,000.00$                  0.450$        18,000.00$            
Waterborne Fast Drying 4" White 1,456,275.00            0.052$                            75,726.30$                  0.061$        88,832.78$            
Waterborne Fast Drying 4" Yellow 3,576,410.00            0.052$                            185,973.32$                0.061$        218,161.01$          
12" White for Crosswalks/Stopbars 34,576.00                  0.490$                            16,942.24$                  0.520$        17,979.52$            
4" White for Parking Lines 32,500.00                  0.280$                            9,100.00$                     0.380$        12,350.00$            
White Directional Arrow 20.00                         25.000$                          500.00$                        26.250$      525.00$                  
White Bicycle 20.00                         25.000$                          500.00$                        36.500$      730.00$                  
White Bicyclist 20.00                         25.000$                          500.00$                        36.500$      730.00$                  
Chlorinated Rubber Low VOC 4" White 16,800.00                  0.054$                            907.20$                        0.061$        1,024.80$              
Chlorinated Rubber Low VOC 4" Yellow 180,000.00                0.054$                            9,720.00$                     0.061$        10,980.00$            
Lead Time
Min. Order for Line Painting
Min. Order for Parking/Crosswalks 6,000 LF

1 week
2,000 LF
1,000 LF

Product Estimated Volume
K5 Corporation Markings, Inc.

2 weeks
50,000 LF



FY22-08 Crack Sealing

Bidder Tax Compliance Form Non Collusion Form Debarment Form OSHA Form Bid Bond Mass Prequal Addendum 1
Sealcoating Inc. DBA Indus Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidder Estimated Product Quantity Bid Price Bid Value
Sealcoating Inc. DBA Indus 15,850.00                                      10.47$                           165,949.50$           

Bidder Estimated Product Quantity Bid Price Bid Value
Sealcoating Inc. DBA Indus 23,150.00                                      12.21$                           282,661.50$           

Section 1: PG & Fiber

Section 2: PCRM



FY22-09 Stone Seal

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Debarment Form Bid Bond Mass Prequalification OSHA Form
All States Asphalt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Comer Contracting, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Estimated Product Quantity Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Product Quantity Bid Price Bid Value
All States Asphalt, Inc. 3,600.00                                      2.95$                               10,620.00$                  3,600.00                                      7.30$      26,280.00$                     
Comer Contracting, Inc. 3,600.00                                      No Bid No Bid 3,600.00                                      No Bid No Bid

Estimated Product Quantity Bid Price Bid Value
All States Asphalt, Inc. 17,000.00                                    2.84$                               48,280.00$                  
Comer Contracting, Inc. 17,000.00                                    2.72$                               46,240.00$                  

Estimated Product Quantity Bid Price Bid Value
All States Asphalt, Inc. 77,340.00                                    2.59$                               200,310.60$                
Comer Contracting, Inc. 77,340.00                                    2.87$                               221,965.80$                

Bidder Old Work
Section 3: Williamstown

Bidder Old Work New Work II
Section 1: Monterey

Bidder Old Work
Section 2: Stockbridge



FY22-10 Hot Mix Asphalt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Debarment Statement OSHA Certification
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidder Estimated Tons Picked Up Bid Price Bid Value
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving 170.00                                         72.00$                                 12,240.00$                      
Trew Stone, LLC 170.00                                         85.00$                                 14,450.00$                      

Bidder Estimated Tons Picked Up Bid Price Bid Value
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving 2,353.00                                      66.00$                                 155,298.00$                    
Trew Stone, LLC 2,353.00                                      70.00$                                 164,710.00$                    

Bidder Estimated Tons Picked Up Bid Price Bid Value
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving 9,620.00                                      64.00$                                 615,680.00$                    
Trew Stone, LLC 9,620.00                                      70.00$                                 673,400.00$                    

Bidder Estimated Tons Picked Up Bid Price Bid Value
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving 2,020.00                                      62.00$                                 125,240.00$                    
Trew Stone, LLC 2,020.00                                      70.00$                                 141,400.00$                    

Section 1: MassDOT Berm

Section 2: MassDOT Dense Top

Section 3: MassDOT Top

Section 4: MassDOT Binder



FY22-11 Winter Rock Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Bid Bond Addendum 1 Addendum 2
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
John S. Lane & Son Yes Yes Yes Yes ? No No
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 9,330.00                     71.00$                                        662,430.00$                    
Cargill, Inc. 9,330.00                     No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 9,330.00                     65.00$                                        606,450.00$                    
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 9,330.00                     No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 9,330.00                     No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 9,330.00                     60.36$                                        563,158.80$                    

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 10,700.00                   71.00$                                        759,700.00$                    
Cargill, Inc. 10,700.00                   No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 10,700.00                   63.00$                                        674,100.00$                    
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,700.00                   No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 10,700.00                   No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 10,700.00                   56.62$                                        605,834.00$                    

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 9,350.00                     71.00$                                        663,850.00$                    
Cargill, Inc. 9,350.00                     No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 9,350.00                     63.00$                                        589,050.00$                    
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 9,350.00                     No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 9,350.00                     No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 9,350.00                     56.89$                                        531,921.50$                    

Section 1: Delivered - North County

Section 2: Delivered - Central County

Section 3: Delivered - South County



FY22-12 Winter Sand

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Bid Bond Addendum 1 Addendum 2
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
John S. Lane & Son Yes Yes Yes Yes ? No No
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 650.00                         27.00$                                          17,550.00$                       2,600.00                         27.00$        70,200.00$     3,000.00                  27.00$        81,000.00$   
Cargill, Inc. 650.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,600.00                         No Bid No Bid 3,000.00                  No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 650.00                         No BId No BId 2,600.00                         No BId No BId 3,000.00                  No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 650.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,600.00                         No Bid No Bid 3,000.00                  No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 650.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,600.00                         No Bid No Bid 3,000.00                  No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 650.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,600.00                         No Bid No Bid 3,000.00                  No Bid No Bid

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 500.00                         27.00$                                          13,500.00$                       1,700.00                         27.00$        45,900.00$     2,950.00                  27.00$        79,650.00$   
Cargill, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid 1,700.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,950.00                  No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 500.00                         No BId No BId 1,700.00                         No BId No BId 2,950.00                  No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid 1,700.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,950.00                  No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 500.00                         No Bid No Bid 1,700.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,950.00                  No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid 1,700.00                         No Bid No Bid 2,950.00                  No Bid No Bid

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 500.00                         21.00$                                          10,500.00$                       
Cargill, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 500.00                         15.00$                                          7,500.00$                         
Morton Salt, Inc. 500.00                         No Bid No Bid

Section 2.2 Coarse Winter Sand Picked Up

Central County South CountyNorth County
Section 1: Regular Winter Sand Delivered

North County Central County South County
Section 2.1 Coarse Winter Sand Delivered



FY22-13 Treated Winter Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Bid Bond Addendum 1 Addendum 2
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
John S. Lane & Son Yes Yes Yes Yes ? No No
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 2,100.00                        No Bid No Bid 7,200.00                        No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 2,100.00                        No Bid No Bid 7,200.00                        No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 2,100.00                        No BId No BId 7,200.00                        No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 2,100.00                        No Bid No Bid 7,200.00                        No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 2,100.00                        No Bid No Bid 7,200.00                        No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 2,100.00                        No Bid No Bid 7,200.00                        No Bid No Bid

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 1,000.00                        85.00$                                         85,000.00$                      1,600.00                        85.00$       136,000.00$  
Cargill, Inc. 1,000.00                        83.86$                                         83,860.00$                      1,600.00                        83.86$       134,176.00$  
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 1,000.00                        No BId No BId 1,600.00                        No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 1,000.00                        No Bid No BId 1,600.00                        No Bid No BId
John S. Lane & Son 1,000.00                        No Bid No BId 1,600.00                        No Bid No BId
Morton Salt, Inc. 1,000.00                        No Bid No BId 1,600.00                        No Bid No BId

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 13,900.00                     No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 13,900.00                     No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 13,900.00                     No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 13,900.00                     1.28$                                            17,792.00$                      
John S. Lane & Son 13,900.00                     No Bid No BId
Morton Salt, Inc. 13,900.00                     No Bid No BId

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 1,450.00                        79.00$                                         114,550.00$                    3,800.00                        79.00$       300,200.00$  600.00                     79.00$       47,400.00$  
Cargill, Inc. 1,450.00                        No Bid No Bid 3,800.00                        No Bid No Bid 600.00                     No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 1,450.00                        No BId No BId 3,800.00                        No BId No BId 600.00                     No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 1,450.00                        No Bid No BId 3,800.00                        No Bid No BId 600.00                     No Bid No BId
John S. Lane & Son 1,450.00                        No Bid No BId 3,800.00                        No Bid No BId 600.00                     No Bid No BId
Morton Salt, Inc. 1,450.00                        75.36$                                         109,272.00$                    3,800.00                        71.62$       272,156.00$  600.00                     71.89$       43,134.00$  

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 5,500.00                        No Bid No Bid 1,500.00                        No Bid No BId
Cargill, Inc. 5,500.00                        No Bid No Bid 1,500.00                        No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 5,500.00                        No BId No BId 1,500.00                        No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 5,500.00                        1.32$                                            7,260.00$                         1,500.00                        1.32$         1,980.00$       
John S. Lane & Son 5,500.00                        No Bid No BId 1,500.00                        No Bid No BId
Morton Salt, Inc. 5,500.00                        No Bid No BId 1,500.00                        No Bid No BId

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 200.00                           83.00$                                         16,600.00$                      300.00                            83.00$       24,900.00$     
Cargill, Inc. 200.00                           No Bid No Bid 300.00                            No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 200.00                           No BId No BId 300.00                            No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 200.00                           No Bid No Bid 300.00                            No Bid No Bid
John S. Lane & Son 200.00                           No Bid No BId 300.00                            No Bid No BId
Morton Salt, Inc. 200.00                           No Bid No BId 300.00                            No Bid No BId

North County South County

Section 3.2 60% Liquid Calcium and 40% Organic based Performance Enhancer; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered
North County South County

North County Central County South County
Section 2.2 80% Liquid Magnesium Chloride and 20% Molasses; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered

Section 3.1 Liquid Calcium and 40% Organic Based Performance Enhancer; Delivered as a Liquid

Section 1.1 50% Magnesium Chloride and 50% Distiller Soluble; Delivered as a Liquid

Section 1.2 50% Magnesium Chloride and 50% Distiller Soluble; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered

South County
Section 2.1 80% Liquid Magnesium Chloride and 20% Molasses; Delivered as a Liquid

South CountyCentral County

North County South County



FY22-14 Gasoline

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page Non-Collusion Form
O'Connell Oil Associaties, inc. Yes Yes Yes

Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value

O'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 171,500.00                                           0.41$                                70,315.00$                    

Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value
O'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 42,650.00                                             0.41$                                17,486.50$                    3,800.00                        0.41$         1,558.00$   125.00                           0.41$         51.25$         

Bidder Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline

Section 1: Central Berkshire County

Section 2: Southern Berkshire County
Minimum 89 Octane Gasoline Minimum 93 Octane Gasoline

Bidder



FY22-15 Diesel Fuel

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page Non-Collusion Form
O'Connell Oil Associaties, inc. Yes Yes Yes
West Oil Company, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products Yes Yes Yes

1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. 0.60$                            0.60$                            0.60$                            
West Oil Company, Inc. 0.36$                            0.36$                            0.31$                            0.57$                            0.57$                            0.55$                            
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 0.42$                            0.42$                            0.40$                            0.59$                            0.59$                            0.57$                            

1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. 0.60$                            0.60$                            0.60$                            No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 0.41$                            0.41$                            0.39$                            0.58$                            0.58$                            0.56$                            

1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. 0.60$                            0.60$                            0.60$                            No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 0.42$                            0.42$                            0.40$                            0.59$                            0.59$                            0.57$                            

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2021 NYMEX Price

Section 1: North Berkshire County

Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2021 NYMEX Price

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2021 NYMEX Price



FY22-16 Heating Oil

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page Non-Collusion Form
O'Connell Oil Associaties, inc. Yes Yes Yes
West Oil Company, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products Yes Yes Yes

1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. 0.60$                                0.60$                                0.60$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. 0.34$                                0.34$                                0.29$                                0.39$                                0.39$                                0.37$                                
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 0.24$                                0.24$                                0.24$                                0.41$                                0.41$                                0.41$                                

1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. 0.60$                                0.60$                                0.60$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 0.22$                                0.22$                                0.22$                                0.39$                                0.39$                                0.39$                                

1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. 0.60$                                0.60$                                0.60$                                No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 0.26$                                0.26$                                0.26$                                0.43$                                0.43$                                0.43$                                

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2021 NYMEX Price

Section 1: North Berkshire County

Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2021 NYMEX Price

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2021 NYMEX Price



FY22-17 Liquid Propane

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page Non-Collusion Form
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products Yes Yes Yes
Superior Plus Energy Yes Yes Yes

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 1,800.00                       1.74$                               3,132.00$                     
Superior Plus Energy 1,800.00                       1.44$                               2,583.00$                     

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 15,300.00                    1.74$                               26,622.00$                   
Superior Plus Energy 15,300.00                    1.44$                               21,955.50$                   

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito Holdings, Inc. DBA Mirabito Energy Products 28,595.00                    1.74$                               49,755.30$                   
Superior Plus Energy 28,595.00                    1.44$                               41,033.83$                   

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County



FY22-18 Catch Basin Cleaning and Line Jetting

Bidder Bid Form Tax Form Non-Collusion Form Debarment Form Bid Bond OSHA Form

REWC Land Management, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Estimated Hours Hourly Rate Bid Value Estimated Hours Hourly Rate Bid Value Estimated Hours Hourly Rate Bid Value
REWC Land Management, Inc. 56 215.00$          12,040.00$                         361 215.00$          77,615.00$  314 215.00$          67,510.00$  

Estimated Hours Hourly Rate Bid Value Estimated Hours Hourly Rate Bid Value
REWC Land Management, Inc. 24 215.00$          5,160.00$                           84 215.00$          18,060.00$  

South County
Section 1: Catch Basin Cleaning

Bidder

Central County South County
Section 2: Line Jetting

Bidder

North County Central County
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