

**FY23-02 Cold Patch**

Bidder	Bid Signature Page	Product Certification Form	Tax Compliance Form	Non-Collusion Form
All States Materials Group	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Palmer Paving	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
White Cap, LP	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

<b>Section 1: Picked Up Products</b>				
Bidder	Type of High-Performance Cold Patch	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Value
All States Materials Group	duraPatch	198	\$ 137.50	\$ 27,225.00
Palmer Paving	No Response/incomplete bid package	198	\$ 135.00	\$ 26,730.00
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	No Bid	198	No Bid	No Bid
White Cap, LP	No Bid	198	No Bid	No Bid

<b>Section 2a: Delivered Product - North County</b>				
Bidder	Type of High-Performance Cold Patch	Estimated Pallets	Bid Price	Bid Value
All States Materials Group	No Bid	13	No Bid	No Bid
Palmer Paving	No Bid	13	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	ProPatch	13	\$ 700.00	\$ 9,100.00
White Cap, LP	Max - A - Patch, ACP	13	\$ 826.00	\$ 10,738.00

<b>Section 2b: Delivered Product - Central County</b>				
Bidder	Type of High-Performance Cold Patch	Estimated Pallets	Bid Price	Bid Value
All States Materials Group	No Bid	7	No Bid	No Bid
Palmer Paving	No Bid	7	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	ProPatch	7	\$ 700.00	\$ 4,900.00
White Cap, LP	Max - A - Patch, ACP	7	\$ 826.00	\$ 5,782.00

<b>Section 2c: Delivered Product - Central County</b>				
Bidder	Type of High-Performance Cold Patch	Estimated Pallets	Bid Price	Bid Value
All States Materials Group	No Bid	12	No Bid	No Bid
Palmer Paving	No Bid	12	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	ProPatch	12	\$ 700.00	\$ 8,400.00
White Cap, LP	Max - A - Patch, ACP	12	\$ 826.00	\$ 9,912.00