

FY23-03 Calcium & Magnesium Chloride

Bidder	Bid Signature Page	Tax Compliance Form	Non-Collusion Form
Safe Road Services	Yes	Yes	Yes
All States Construction, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes

Section 1a: Delivered as a Liquid - North County									
Bidder	Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Gallons - Magnesium Chloride	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70	Bid Price	Bid Value
Safe Road Services	9,000.00	no bid	no bid	-	NA	NA	-	NA	NA
All States Construction, Inc.	9,000.00	\$ 1.19	\$ 10,710.00	-	NA	NA	-	NA	NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	9,000.00	\$ 1.05	\$ 9,450.00	-	NA	NA	-	NA	NA

Section 1b: Delivered as a Liquid - Central County									
Bidder	Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Gallons - Magnesium Chloride	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70	Bid Price	Bid Value
Safe Road Services	-	NA	NA	2,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	20,000.00	\$ 1.42	\$28,400.00
All States Construction, Inc.	-	NA	NA	2,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	-	NA	NA	2,000.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 1,980.00	20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid

Section 1c: Delivered as a Liquid - South County									
Bidder	Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Gallons - Magnesium Chloride	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70	Bid Price	Bid Value
Safe Road Services	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	3,200.00	\$ 1.42	\$ 4,544.00
All States Construction, Inc.	10,000.00	\$ 1.19	\$ 1,190.00	13,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,200.00	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	10,000.00	\$ 1.05	\$ 10,500.00	13,500.00	\$ 0.99	\$ 13,365.00	3,200.00	No Bid	No Bid

Section 2: Products Delivered in 50lbs. Bags									
Bidder - Calcium Chloride	Estimated Bags - North County	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Bags - Central County	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Bags - South County	Bid Price	Bid Value
Safe Road Services	50.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.00	No Bid	No Bid	-	No Bid	No Bid
All States Construction, Inc.	50.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.00	No Bid	No Bid	-	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	50.00	No Bid	No Bid	60.00	No Bid	No Bid	-	No Bid	No Bid

Section 2 Products Delivered in 50lbs Bags									
Bidder -Magnesium Chloride	Estimated Bags - North County	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Bags - Central County	Bid Price	Bid Value	Estimated Bags - South County	Bid Price	Bid Value
Safe Road Services	50.00	No Bid	No Bid	-	N/A	N/A	-	N/A	N/A
All States Construction, Inc.	50.00	No Bid	No Bid	-	N/A	N/A	-	N/A	N/A
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	50.00	No Bid	No Bid	-	N/A	N/A	-	N/A	N/A