
FY23-11 Winter Rock Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Bid Bond Addendum 1
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 10,060.00                  81.00$                                       814,860.00$                   Winner
Cargill, Inc. 10,060.00                  No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 10,060.00                  92.00$                                       925,520.00$                   
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,060.00                  No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 10,060.00                  79.05$                                       795,243.00$                   Rejected - Unresponsive/Irresponsible

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 12,950.00                  78.00$                                       1,010,100.00$                Winner
Cargill, Inc. 12,950.00                  No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 12,950.00                  92.50$                                       1,197,875.00$                
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 12,950.00                  No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 12,950.00                  75.99$                                       984,070.50$                   Rejected - Unresponsive/Irresponsible

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 11,700.00                  78.00$                                       912,600.00$                   
Cargill, Inc. 11,700.00                  No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 11,700.00                  89.00$                                       1,041,300.00$                
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 11,700.00                  No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 11,700.00                  78.20$                                       914,940.00$                   

Section 1: Delivered - North County

Section 2: Delivered - Central County

Section 3: Delivered - South County
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