

FY23-12 Winter Sand

Bidder	Bid Signature Page	Product Certification Form	Tax Compliance Form	Non-Collusion Form	Bid Bond	Addendum 1
Apalachee, LLC	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Cargill, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Eastern Minerals, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
Morton Salt, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes

Section 1: Regular Winter Sand Delivered									
Bidder	North County			Central County			South County		
	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC	650.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 17,550.00	2,600.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 70,200.00	3,000.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 81,000.00
Cargill, Inc.	650.00	No Bid	No Bid	2,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc.	650.00	No Bid	No Bid	2,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	650.00	No Bid	No Bid	2,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc.	650.00	No Bid	No Bid	2,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,000.00	No Bid	No Bid

Section 1.2 Regular Winter Sand Picked Up			
Bidder	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC	450.00	\$ 17.92	\$ 8,064.00
Cargill, Inc.	450.00	No Bid	No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc.	450.00	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	450.00	No Bid	No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc.	450.00	No Bid	No Bid

Section 2.1 Coarse Winter Sand Delivered									
Bidder	North County			Central County			South County		
	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC	-	No Bid	No Bid	3,300.00	\$ 29.00	\$ 95,700.00	3,700.00	\$ 28.00	\$ 103,600.00
Cargill, Inc.	-	No Bid	No Bid	3,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc.	-	No Bid	No Bid	3,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	-	No Bid	No Bid	3,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc.	-	No Bid	No Bid	3,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	3,700.00	No Bid	No Bid

Section 2.2 Coarse Winter Sand Picked Up			
Bidder	Estimated Tons	Bid Price	Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC	800.00	\$ 17.92	\$ 14,336.00
Cargill, Inc.	800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc.	800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc.	800.00	No Bid	No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc.	800.00	No Bid	No Bid