

FY23-16 Heating Oil

Bidder Name	Bid Signature Page	Tax Compliance Page	Non-Collusion Form
O'Connell Oil Associates, inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes
West Oil Company, Inc.	Yes	Yes	Yes
Mirabito	Yes	Yes	Yes

Section 1: North Berkshire County						
Bidder	Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery)			Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Price		
	1 - 1,000 gal.	1,001 - 3,000 gal.	3,001+ gal.	1 - 1,000 gal.	1,001 - 3,000 gal.	3,001+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc.	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lipton Energy	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mirabito	\$ 0.36	\$ 0.36	\$ 0.32	\$ 0.43	\$ 0.43	\$ 0.43

Section 2: Central Berkshire County						
Bidder	Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery)			Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Price		
	1 - 1,000 gal.	1,001 - 3,000 gal.	3,001+ gal.	1 - 1,000 gal.	1,001 - 3,000 gal.	3,001+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc.	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lipton Energy	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mirabito	\$ 0.43	\$ 0.43	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.52	\$ 0.52	\$ 0.52

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County						
Bidder	Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery)			Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Price		
	1 - 1,000 gal.	1,001 - 3,000 gal.	3,001+ gal.	1 - 1,000 gal.	1,001 - 3,000 gal.	3,001+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc.	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.60	\$ 0.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Lipton Energy	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.39	\$ 0.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Mirabito	0.46	0.46	0.42	0.55	0.55	0.55