FY23-01 Aggregates & Loam




FY23-01 Picked Up Products

Bidder Bid Signature Form_| Product Certification Form
Century Aggregates, Inc. Yes Yes
John'S. Lane & Son Yes Yes
Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Yes Yes
Tonlino & Sons, LLC Yes Yes
Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes
Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc. Yes Yes
Section 1: Up Aggregates
product Units Estimated Volume | Century Inc. John S. Lane & Son Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value | Bid Price Bid Value | Bid Price Bid Value
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 2,000.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 100.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 280.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 2350 [ $ 6,580.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5600.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,500.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Hard Pack Tons 50.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.50 525.00 | No Bid No Bid s 9.75 [ $  487.50 | NoBid No Bid
1/2" Washed Gravel Stone Tons zsngo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1525 381.25 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 75.00 | No Bid hu Bid No Bid No Bid 15.50 1,162.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 50.00 [No Bid [No Bid o Bid 0 Bid 17.50 875.00 | No Bid No Bid 0 Bid 0 Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 2,300.00 | No Bid No Bid 23.65 54,395.00 32.00 73,600.00 | § 21.50 | § 49,450.00 17.00 | S 39,100.00 | No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 900.00 18.00 16,200.00 23.15 20,835.00 32.00 28,800.00 | No Bid 0 Bid 17.00 | $ 15,300.00 18.00 16,200.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,750.00 18.00 31,500.00 22.80 39,900.00 32.00 56,000.00 16.20 | $ 28,350.00 16.00 | $ 28,000.00 18.00 31,500.00
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 400.00 18.00 7,200.00 21.40 8,560.00 32.00 12,800.00 1550 [ S 6,200.00 16.00 6,400.00 18.00 7,200.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,950.00 18.00 35,100.00 22.75 44,362.50 | No Bid No Bid 14.90 | § 29,055.00 15.75 | $ 30,712.50 18.00 35,100.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 2,700.00 18.00 48,600.00 20.40 55,080.00 | No Bid No Bid 1450 | 39,150.00 1575 | $ 42525.00 18.00 48,600.00
1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Tons 100.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 14.90 [ $ 1,490.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 91000 [ § 21.00 19,110.00 [ § 2560 [ $ 23,296.00 | No Bid No Bid 15.00 [ $ 13,650.00 18.00 | $ 16,380.00 No Bid
Dumped Rip Rap Tons 100.00 [No Bid No Bid s 2375 [ § 2,375.00 | No Bid No Bid 18.95 | $ 1,895.00 18.00 | § hu Bid
Modified Rockfill Tons 200.00 [No Bid No Bid $ 2560 [ $ 5,120.00 [ No Bid No Bid 18.95 | $ 3,790.00 1800 $ No Bid




FY23-01 Delivered Products

Section 2a: Delivered Bids - North County

Product Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. John S. Lane & Son Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 100.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Screened Gravel Tons 400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Tons 100.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2775 | S 2,775.00 | No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 300.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 100.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 350.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34.00 | S 11,900.00 | No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 500.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34.50 | S 17,250.00 | $ 33.00 | S 16,500.00 28.00 | S 14,000.00
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 300.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 34.50 | S 10,350.00 | $ 33.00 | S 9,900.00 28.00 | S 8,400.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3250 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 3150 | $ 6,300.00 30.00 | $ 6,000.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3250 |$  13,000.00 | $ 3275|$  13,100.00 30.00 | $ 12,000.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 50.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3450 | $ 1,725.00 | $ 3500 | $ 1,750.00 | No Bid No Bid
Dumped Rip Rap Tons 50.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 1,900.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2b: Delivered Bids - Central County
Product Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. John S. Lane & Son Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 300.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 40.00 | $ 12,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 240.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Tons 200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 29.75 | S 5,950.00 | No Bid No Bid
11/2" Unwashed Gravel Stone Tons 200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 500.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.50 | $ 18,750.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 18,500.00 | No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 700.00 | S 24.00 | $ 16,800.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 37.50 | $ 26,250.00 | S 28.00 | S 19,600.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,600.00 | S 28.00 | $ 44,800.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 29.25 | S 46,800.00 | $ 36.00 | S 57,600.00 | $ 28.00 | S 44,800.00
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,400.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 42,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2805 % 39,270.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 50,400.00 | $ 3000 | $ 42,000.00
3/4" Dense Graded C rushed Stone Tons 4,000.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 112,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.75 | $ 111,000.00 | $ 33.75|$ 135,000.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 112,000.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 27.15|$ 38010.00 | $ 3375 |$  47,250.00 | NoBid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 40.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.05 S 1,122.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section 2c: Delivered Bids - Central County
Product Units Estimated Volume Century Aggregates, Inc. John S. Lane & Son Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
11/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 250.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 300.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3533 | S 10,599.00 [ No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 300.00 | $ 28.00 8,400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 2,250.00 | $ 28.00 63,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2953 | S 66,442.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,600.00 | S 28.00 44,800.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2833 | S 45,328.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded C rushed Stone Tons 2,100.00 | $ 28.00 58,800.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 28.03 | $ 58,863.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 2,200.00 | $ 28.00 |$  61,600.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2743 |$  60,346.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Tons 2,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2623 | S 52,460.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 550.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2833 [ S 15,581.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Modified Rockfill Tons 250.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3228% 8,070.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




FY23-01 Winning Bids by Municipality

Municipality | Product Delivery Method Volume Winning Bidder Bid Price Total Bid
North County
3/4" Screened Gravel Delivered 400.00 (No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Delivered 400.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Adams 3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered 100.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered 100.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 200.00 |Troy Sand & Gravel S 30.00|$ 6,000.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 400.00 |Troy Sand & Gravel S 30.00 | $ 12,000.00
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 600.00 [Trew Stone, LLC S 34.00 | $ 20,400.00
Cheshire 3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 500.00 [Troy Sand & Gravel S 28.00 | $ 14,000.00
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 300.00 |Troy Sand & Gravel S 28.00|$ 8,400.00
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Delivered 100.00 [Trew Stone, LLC S 27.75|$ 2,775.00
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered 100.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Ashford 3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 50.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 34.00|S$ 1,700.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Delivered 50.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 3450|$ 1,725.00
Dumped Rip Rap Delivered 50.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 38.00|$ 1,900.00
Loam Delivered 100.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
North Adams - - - -
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered 100.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Central County
11/2" Crushed Gravel Delivered 100.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Delivered 200.00 |Trew Stone, LLC $ 29.75|$ 5,950.00
Lanesborough |3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 200.00 (Tied Bid S 28.00|S$ 5,600.00
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 200.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 28.05|$ 5,610.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Delivered 40.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 28.05|$ 1,122.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 200.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.15|$ 5,430.00
1/2" Washed Gravel Stone Picked Up 25.00 |Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC S 15.25 | S 381.25
Lenox 11/2" Washed Gravel Stone Picked Up 50.00 |Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLCQ S 17.50 | S 875.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 200.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC 14.50 | $ 2,900.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Picked Up 100.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC 15.00 | $ 1,500.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 400.00 [Tied Bid S 28.00|$ 11,200.00
Peru 1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 200.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 28.05|S$ 5,610.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 1,000.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.75|$ 27,750.00
3/4" Screened Gravel Delivered 400.00 (No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pittsfield Loam Delivered 300.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 40.00 | $ 12,000.00
1 1/2" Unwashed Gravel Stone Delivered 200.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 200.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. S 24.00|$ 4,800.00




3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 500.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 37.00 | $ 18,500.00
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 500.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. S 24.00|$ 12,000.00
Richmond 3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 1,000.00 [Tied Bid S 28.00 | $ 28,000.00
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 800.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 28.05]|$ 22,440.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 3,000.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.75]| S 83,250.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 1,000.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.15|$ 27,150.00

11/2" Crushed Gravel Delivered 140.00 |No Bid No Bid No Bid
Windsor 1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 200.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 28.05|S$ 5,610.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 200.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.15|$ 5,430.00

South County

3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 50.00 [Century Aggregates, Inc. $ 28.00|$ 1,400.00
1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 100.00 [Century Aggregates, Inc. $ 28.00|$ 2,800.00
Alford 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 100.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. $ 28.00|S 2,800.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 200.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.43|S$ 5,486.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Delivered 50.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 2833|$ 1,416.50
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 1,000.00 |Trew Stone, LLC $ 16.00 | $ 16,000.00
Becket 11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 1,500.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 14.50 | $ 21,750.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Picked Up 200.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 15.00 | $ 3,000.00
Dumped Rip Rap Picked Up 100.00 |Trew Stone, LLC $ 18.00$ 1,800.00

Egremont 11/2" Crushed Gravel Delivered 1,000.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 200.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. $ 28.00|$ 5,600.00
Loam Picked Up 100.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 20.00|$ 2,000.00
Lee 3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Picked Up 75.00 [Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLCO0 $ 15,50 [ $ 1,162.50
Rip Rap 6" Max Picked Up 30.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 1500 ]S 450.00
Loam Picked Up 100.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 20.00|$ 2,000.00
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 1,000.00 |Trew Stone, LLC $ 17.00 | $ 17,000.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 400.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 16.00|$ 6,400.00
Monterey 1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 400.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 1550 | S 6,200.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 500.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 1490 |S$ 7,450.00
Rip Rap 6" Max Picked Up 500.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 15.00|$ 7,500.00
Modified Rockfill Picked Up 200.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 18.00|$ 3,600.00

1" Minus Crushed Gravel Delivered 250.00 [No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 300.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 35.33|$10,599.00
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 300.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. S 28.00|$ 8,400.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 2,000.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. $ 28.00 | $ 56,000.00
Mt. Washington 1 1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Delivered 1,500.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. S 28.00 | $ 42,000.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 2,000.00 |Century Aggregates, Inc. $ 28.00 | $ 56,000.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Delivered 2,000.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 27.43 | $ 54,860.00




1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Delivered 2,000.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 26.23 | $ 52,460.00

Rip Rap 6" Max Delivered 500.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 28.33|$ 14,165.00

Modified Rockfill Delivered 250.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 32.28|S$ 8,070.00

Loam Picked Up 80.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 20.00|$ 1,600.00

Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Picked Up 50.00 [Trew Stone, LLC S 9.75|$ 487.50

Stockbridge 3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 1,000.00 |Trew Stone, LLC $ 17.00 | $ 17,000.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 50.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 14901 S 745.00

Rip Rap 6" Max Picked Up 80.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC $ 15.00|$ 1,200.00

3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 200.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 16.00|$ 3,200.00

Tyringham 3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 1,000.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 14.90 | $ 14,900.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 1,000.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 14.50 | $ 14,500.00

3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 300.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 17.00|$ 5,100.00

1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 900.00 [Trew Stone, LLC $ 17.00 | $ 15,300.00

West Stockbridge |3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Picked Up 150.00 |Trew Stone, LLC $ 16.00 | S 2,400.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Picked Up 400.00 [Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 1490 |S$ 5,960.00

1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Picked Up 100.00 |Tonlino & Sons, LLC S 1490 |S$ 1,490.00




FY23-01 No Bids

Municipality | Product

| Delivery Method

North County

3/4" Screened Gravel Delivered

1" Minus Crushed Gravel Delivered
Adams -

3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered

11/2" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered
New Ashford 3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered
North Adams Loam DeI!vered

3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Delivered

Central County

Lanesborough 11/2" Crushed Gravel Delivered
Lenox 1 1/2" Minus Screened Gravel Picked Up
pittsfield 3/4" Screened Gravel DeI!vered

11/2" Unwashed Gravel Stone Delivered
Windsor 11/2" Crushed Gravel Delivered

South County

Egremont 11/2" Crushed Gravel Delivered
Lee 3/4" Screened Gravel Picked Up

11/2" Crushed Gravel Picked Up
Monterey - -

1" Minus Crushed Gravel Picked Up
Mt.Washington |1" Minus Crushed Gravel Delivered
Stockbridge 1 1/2. Crushed Gravel P!cked Up

1" Minus Crushed Gravel Picked Up




FY23-02 Cold Patch




FY23-02 Cold Patch

Bidder

Bid Signature Page

Product Certification Form

Tax Compliance Form

Non-Collusion Form

All States Materials Group Yes Yes Yes Yes
Palmer Paving Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes
White Cap, LP Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Picked Up Products
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Value
All States Materials Group duraPatch 198| $ 137.50 | $ 27,225.00
Palmer Paving No Response/incomplete bid package 198 $ 135.00 | $ 26,730.00
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. No Bid 198| No Bid No Bid
White Cap, LP No Bid 198( No Bid No Bid
Section 2a: Delivered Product - North County
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
All States Materials Group No Bid 13| No Bid No Bid
Palmer Paving No Bid 13| No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 13 S 700.00 | S 9,100.00
White Cap, LP Max - A - Patch, ACP 13| $ 826.00 | S 10,738.00
Section 2b: Delivered Product - Central County
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
All States Materials Group No Bid 7| No Bid No Bid
Palmer Paving No Bid 7| No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch VRS 700.00 | S 4,900.00
Whte Cap, LP Max - A - Patch, ACP 7| $ 826.00 | S 5,782.00
Section 2c: Delivered Product - Central County
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
All States Materials Group No Bid 12| No Bid No Bid
Palmer Paving No Bid 12| No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 12| S 700.00 | S 8,400.00
White Cap, LP Max - A - Patch, ACP 12| $ 826.00 | S 9,912.00




FY23-03 Calcium & Magnesium
Chloride




FY23-03 Calcium & Magnesium Chloride

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax C e Form Non-Coll Form
Safe Road Services Yes Yes Yes
All States Construction, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Section 1a: Delivered as a Liquid - North County
Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - M. Chloride Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price | Bid Value
Safe Road Services 9,000.00 | no bid no bid - NA NA - NA NA
All States Construction, Inc. 9,000.00 | $ 119 | $ 10,710.00 - NA NA - NA NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 9,000.00 | $ 1.05 | $ 9,450.00 - NA NA - NA NA
Section 1b: Delivered as a Liquid - Central County
Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - M. Chloride Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price | Bid Value
Safe Road Services - NA NA 2,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 20,000.00 | $ 1.42 | $28,400.00
All States Construction, Inc. - NA NA 2,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 20,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. - NA NA 2,000.00 | $ 0.99 | $ 1,980.00 20,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 1c: Delivered as a Liquid - South County
Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - M. Chloride Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price | Bid Value
Safe Road Services no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 3,200.00 | $ 1.42 | $ 4,544.00
All States Construction, Inc. 10,000.00 | $ 119 [ S 1.05 13,500.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,200.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,000.00 | $ 1.05 | $ 10,500.00 13,500.00 | $ 0.99 | $ 13,365.00 3,200.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2: Products Delivered in 50lbs. Bags
Bidder - Calcium Chloride Estimated Bags - North County Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Bags - Central County Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Bags - South County Bid Price | Bid Value
Safe Road Services 50.00 | No Bid No Bid 60.00 | No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid
All States Construction, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid 60.00 | No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid 60.00 | No Bid No Bid - No Bid No Bid
Section 2 Products Delivered in 50lbs Bags
Bidder -M. Chloride Estimated Bags - North County Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Bags - Central County Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Bags - South County Bid Price | Bid Value
Safe Road Services 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - N/A N/A - N/A N/A
All States Construction, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - N/A N/A - N/A N/A
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - N/A N/A - N/A N/A




FY23-04 Culvert Products




FY23-04 Culvert Products

Bidder

Bid Signature Page

Tax Compliance Form

Non-Collusion Form

EJ Prescott, Inc.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Section 1: Single Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - South County

Section 2a: Double Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - North County

EJ Prescott, Inc.

EJ Prescott, Inc.

Product Estimated Feet of Piping - - -
Bid Price Bid Total
6" Solid 100.00 | $ 6.50 | S  650.00
10" Solid 100.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 1,600.00
12" Solid 300.00 [$ 14.15 | $ 4,245.00
15" Solid 220.00 | $ 18.21 | $ 4,006.20
18" Solid 22000 [$ 27.29 | $ 6,003.80
24" Solid 220.00 | $ 41.20 | S 9,064.00

Section 2c¢: Double Wall

Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Pip

ing - South County

Product

Estimated Number of Couplings

EJ Prescott, Inc.

Bid Price Bid Total
12" Solid 640.00 | $ 14.15 | $ 9,056.00
12" Perforated 100.00 | $ 14.15 | $  1,415.00
15" Solid 1,400.00 | S 18.21 | $ 25,494.00
18" Solid 1,060.00 [ $  27.29 | S 28,927.40
24" Solid 640.00 | $ 41.20 | S 26,368.00
36" Solid 60.00 [$ 82.13 | S 4,927.80
48" Solid 100.00 | $ 130.15 | S 13,015.00

Section 3b: Double Wall Couplings - South County
Product Estimated Number of Couplings - E{ Prescot.t, Inc.

Bid Price Bid Total

24" Split 2.00|S 75.00 | $ 150.00

Product Estimated Feet of Piping - - ~
Bid Price Bid Total
15" Solid 120.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,200.00
18" Solid 120.00 | No Bid No Bid
24" Solid 80.00 | No Bid No Bld
Section 2b: Double Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - Central County
Product Estimated Feet of Piping — B Prescott,. Inc.
Bid Price Bid Total
10" Solid 40.00 | $ 16.00 [ $ 640.00
10" Perforated 200.00 | $ 16.00 | S 3,200.00
12" Solid 120.00 | $ 14.15 [ $ 1,698.00
12" Perforated 200.00 | $ 14.15 | S 2,830.00
15" Solid 120.00 | $ 18.21 [ $ 2,185.20
15" Perforated 100.00 | $ 18.21 | S 1,821.00
18" Solid 580.00 [ $ 27.29 [ $ 15,828.20
18" Perforated 300.00 | $ 27.29 | $ 8,187.00
24" Solid 500.00 [ $ 41.20 | $ 20,600.00
24" Perforated 60.00 | $ 41.20 | $ 2,472.00
30" Solid 200.00 [ $ 66.09 [ $ 13,218.00
Section 3a: Double Wall Couplings - North County
Product Estimated Number of Couplings — B Prescottf Inc.
Bid Price Bid Total
24" Split 4.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 300.00
24" Watertight 4.00 | $ 360.84 | $ 1,443.36




FY23-11 Winter Rock Salt




FY23-11 Winter Rock Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page |Product Certification Form [Tax Compliance Form [Non-Collusion Form |Bid Bond [Addendum 1

Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Delivered - North County

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total

Apalachee, LLC 10,060.00 | S 81.00 | S 814,860.00 |Winner

Cargill, Inc. 10,060.00 | No Bid No Bid

Eastern Minerals, Inc. 10,060.00 | $ 92.00 | S 925,520.00

Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,060.00 | No Bid No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. 10,060.00 | $ 79.05 | S 795,243.00 [Rejected - Unresponsive/Irresponsible
Section 2: Delivered - Central County

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total

Apalachee, LLC 12,950.00 | S 78.00 | S 1,010,100.00 |Winner

Cargill, Inc. 12,950.00 | No Bid No Bid

Eastern Minerals, Inc. 12,950.00 | S 9250 | S 1,197,875.00

Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 12,950.00 | No Bid No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. 12,950.00 | S 75.99 | S 984,070.50 [Rejected - Unresponsive/Irresponsible
Section 3: Delivered - South County

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total

Apalachee, LLC 11,700.00 | S 78.00 | S 912,600.00

Cargill, Inc. 11,700.00 | No Bid No Bid

Eastern Minerals, Inc. 11,700.00 | $ 89.00 | S 1,041,300.00

Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 11,700.00 | No Bid No Bid

Morton Salt, Inc. 11,700.00 | S 7820 | S 914,940.00




FY23-12 Winter Sand




FY23-12 Winter Sand

Bidder Bid Signature Page [Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form |Non-Collusion Form |Bid Bond [Addendum 1
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Regular Winter Sand Delivered
North County Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 650.00 [ $ 27.00 | $ 17,550.00 2,600.00 | S 27.00 | $ 70,200.00 3,000.00 | S 27.00|S 81,000.00
Cargill, Inc. 650.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,600.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 650.00 | No BId No Bld 2,600.00 | No BIid No Bld 3,000.00 | No BId No Bld
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 650.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,600.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 650.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,600.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 1.2 Regular Winter Sand Picked Up
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 450.00 | S 17.92 | $ 8,064.00
Cargill, Inc. 450.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 450.00 | No BId No Bld
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 450.00 | No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 450.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2.1 Coarse Winter Sand Delivered
North County Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC - No Bid No Bid 3,300.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 95,700.00 3,700.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 103,600.00
Cargill, Inc. - No Bid No Bid 3,300.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,700.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. - No Bld No Bld 3,300.00 | No BId No Bld 3,700.00 | No BId No Bld
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. - No Bid No Bid 3,300.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,700.00 | No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. - No Bid No Bid 3,300.00 | No Bid No Bid 3,700.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2.2 Coarse Winter Sand Picked Up
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 800.00 | $ 17.92 | $ 14,336.00
Cargill, Inc. 800.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 800.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 800.00 | No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 800.00 | No Bid No Bid




FY23-13 Treated Winter Salt




FY23-13 Treated Winter Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form  |Tax C i Form__|Non-Collusion Form _|Bid Bond ddendum 1
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1.1 50% Chloride and 50% Distiller Soluble; Delivered as a Liquid
South County
Bidder d Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 5,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 5,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 5,000.00 | No BId No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 5,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 5,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 1.2 50% Chloride and 50% Distiller Soluble; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered
North County Central County
Bidder d Tons Bid Price Bid Total d Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 1,200.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 117,600.00 1,250.00 [$ 95.00 [ $ 118,750.00
Cargill, Inc. 1,200.00 | $ 109.46 | $ 131,352.00 1,250.00 [ $ 109.46 | S 136,825.00
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 1,200.00 | $ 122.50 | $ 147,000.00 1,250.00 | $ 122.50 [ $ 153,125.00
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 1,200.00 | No Bid No Bld 1,250.00 | No Bid No Bld
Morton Salt, Inc. 1,200.00 | No Bid No BId 1,250.00 | No Bid No BId
Section 2.1 80% Liquid Chloride and 20% | Delivered as a Liquid
Central South County
Bidder d Gallons Bid Price Bid Total d Gallons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 3,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 8,700.00 | No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 3,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 8,700.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 3,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 8,700.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 3,000.00 | $ 138 | $ 4,140.00 8,700.00 | $ 1.38 | $ 12,006.00
Morton Salt, Inc. 3,000.00 | No Bid No BId 8,700.00 | No Bid No BId
Section 2.2 80% Liquid Chloride and 20% I; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered
North County Central County South County
Bidder d Tons Bid Price Bid Total d Tons Bid Price | Bid Total Estimated Tons | Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 1,350.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 132,300.00 1,550.00 [ $ 95.00 [ $ 147,250.00 2,400.00 | $ 95.00 [ $ 228,000.00
Cargill, Inc. 1,350.00 | No Bid No Bid 1,550.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,400.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 1,350.00 | No BId No BId 1,550.00 | No BId No BId 2,400.00 | No BId No Bld
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 1,350.00 | No Bid No Bld 1,550.00 | No Bid No Bld 2,400.00 | No Bid No Bld
Morton Salt, Inc. 1,350.00 | No BId No Bid 1,550.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,400.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 3.1 Liquid Calcium and 40% Organic Based Performance Enhancer; Delivered as a Liquid
North County Central County South County
Bidder d Tons Bid Price Bid Total d Tons Bid Price | Bid Total Estimated Tons | Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 5,500.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 1,500.00 | No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 5,500.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,400.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 5,500.00 | No BId No BId 10,000.00 | No Bld No BId 2,400.00 | No BId No Bld
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 5,500.00 | $ 1423 7,810.00 10,000.00 | $ 142 | $ 14,200.00 2,400.00 | $ 142 |3 3,408.00
Morton Salt, Inc. 5,500.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,400.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 3.2 60% Liquid Calcium and 40% Organic based Performance Enhancer; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered
Central County South County
Bidder d Tons Bid Price Bid Total d Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 50.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 5,150.00 800.00 | S 103.00 | $  82,400.00
Cargill, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid 800.00 | No Bid No Bid
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 50.00 | No Bld No BId 800.00 | No Bld No BId
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid 800.00 | No Bid No Bid
Morton Salt, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No BId 800.00 | No Bid No BId




FY23-14 Gasoline




FY23-14 Gasoline

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page |Non-Collusion Form
0O'Connell Oil Associaties, inc. Yes Yes Yes
Lipton Energy Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: North Berkshire County
. Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline
Bidder
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value
O'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 3,000.00 | S 041 |$ 1,230.00
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
. Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline
Bidder
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value
0O'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 159,200.00 | $ 041 |$ 65,272.00
Lipton Energy (Pittsfield and Lenox only) 159,200.00 | No Bid No Bid

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Minimum 89 Octane Gasoline

Minimum 93 Octane Gasoline

Bidder Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons Bid Price | Bid Value [ Estimated Gallons Bid Price | Bid Value
O'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 43,200.00 | $ 0.41|$ 17,712.00 3,800.00 | $ 0.41 | $ 1,558.00 200.00 | $ 0.41|$ 82.00




FY23-15 Diesel




FY23-15 Diesel Fuel

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page [Tax Compliance Page |Non-Collusion Form
QO'Connell Oil Associaties, inc. Yes Yes Yes
Lipton Eneergy Yes Yes Yes
Mirabito Yes Yes Yes

Section 1: North Berkshire County

Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery)

Dption B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Pric¢

fon C: Winterized Diesel/November 1 through Marc

xed Price Futures Winter Diesel/November 1 throu

Bidder 1- 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. 2,500+ gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. | 2,500+ gal.
0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.60 | $ 0.60 [ S 0.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 0.60 No Bid No Bid
Lipton Energy S 0.649 | $ 0.649 | $ 0.649 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 0.649 No Bid No Bid
Mirabito S 052 |$S 052 |$ 048 | S 099 | S 099 | S S 0.82 S 133 |$ 1.33

Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Dption B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Pricgon C: Winterized Diesel/November 1 through Marcjxed Price Futures Winter Diesel/November 1 throu,
1- 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. 2,500+ gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. | 2,500+ gal.
0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.60 | $ 0.60 [ S 0.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 0.60 No Bid No Bid
Lipton Energy S 0.649 | $ 0.649 | $ 0.649 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 0.649 No Bid No Bid
Mirabito 0.56 0.56 0.51 1.04 1.04 S 0.85 S 138 |$ 1.38
Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Dption B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Pricgon C: Winterized Diesel/November 1 through Marcjxed Price Futures Winter Diesel/November 1 throu,
1- 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. 2,500+ gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. | 2,500+ gal.
0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.60 | $ 0.60 [ S 0.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 0.60 No Bid No Bid
Lipton Energy S 0.649 | $ 0.649 | $ 0.649 | No Bid No Bid No Bid S 0.649 No Bid No Bid
Mirabito S 058 | S 058 | $ 058 | S 1.04 [ $ 1.04 | $ S 0.92 S 138 |$ 1.38




FY23-15 Option A Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 9,000.00 [Mirabito S 052 |$ 052 |$ 0.48 [ $ 4,320.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 052|$ 052|$ 0.48 | $ 4,800.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 |Mirabito S 052 (S 052 (S 0.48 [ $ 2,016.00
Florida 9,300.00 |Mirabito S 052|$ 052 |$ 0.48 | S 4,464.00
Mt. Greylock School District 300.00 |Mirabito S 052 (S 052 (S 0.48 (S 156.00
North Adams 2,500.00 |Mirabito S 052 |$ 052 |$ 0.48 | $ 1,300.00
Williamstown 19,000.00 |Mirabito S 052 (S 052 (S 0.48 [ $ 9,120.00
Total 54,300.00 $ 26,176.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 18,000.00 |Mirabito S 056 | $ 056 | $ 0.51|$ 9,180.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 056 (S 056 (S 0.51 | $ 5,100.00
Lenox 15,000.00 |Mirabito S 056 | $ 056 | $ 0.51|$ 7,650.00
Peru 5,000.00 [Mirabito S 0.56 | $ 0.56 | $ 0.51 [ $ 2,550.00
Pittsfield 60,500.00 [Mirabito S 056 | $ 056 | $ 0.51 | $ 30,855.00
Richmond 8,000.00 [Mirabito S 0.56 | $ 0.56 | $ 0.51 [ $ 4,080.00
Washington 4,000.00 [Mirabito S 056 | $ 056 | $ 0.51|$ 2,040.00
Windsor 10,000.00 [Mirabito S 0.56 | $ 0.56 | $ 0.51 [ $ 5,100.00
Total 130,500.00 $ 66,555.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Alford 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 058 |$ 058 |$ 0.58 | $ 1,740.00
Becket 12,000.00 [Mirabito S 058 | $ 058 | $ 0.58 [ $ 6,960.00
Egremont 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 058 |$ 058 |$ 0.58 | $ 2,900.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |Mirabito S 058 (S 058 (S 0.58 [ $ 4,930.00
Mt. Washington 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 058 |$ 058 |$ 0.58 | $ 2,900.00
Otis 8,400.00 [Mirabito S 058 | $ 058 | $ 0.58 [ $ 4,872.00
Sheffield 6,000.00 |Mirabito S 058 |$ 058 |$ 0.58 | $ 3,480.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 058 (S 058 (S 0.58 [ $ 2,900.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 058 |$ 058 |$ 0.58 | $ 2,900.00
Total 57,900.00 $ 33,582.00




FY23-15 Option B Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 9,000.00 [Mirabito S 099 |$ 099 |$ 099 [$ 8,910.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 099 |$ 099 |$ 099 |$ 9,900.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 |Mirabito S 099 (S 099 (S 099 S 4,158.00
Florida 9,300.00 |Mirabito S 099 |$ 099 |$ 099 |$ 9,207.00
Mt. Greylock School District 300.00 |Mirabito S 099 (S 099 (S 099 (S 297.00
North Adams 2,500.00 |Mirabito S 099 |$ 099 |$ 099 |$ 2,475.00
Williamstown 19,000.00 [Mirabito S 099 |$ 099 |$ 0.99 [ $ 18,810.00
Total 54,300.00 $ 53,757.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 18,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 18,720.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04|S 1.04|S 1.04 | $ 10,400.00
Lenox 15,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 15,600.00
Peru 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 ]S 1.04 ]S 1.04 | S 5,200.00
Pittsfield 60,500.00 [Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 62,920.00
Richmond 8,000.00 [Mirabito S 1.04 | $ 1.04 | $ 1.04 [ $ 8,320.00
Washington 4,000.00 [Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 4,160.00
Windsor 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04|S 1.04|S 1.04 | $ 10,400.00
Total 130,500.00 $ 135,720.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Alford 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04|$ 3,120.00
Becket 12,000.00 [Mirabito S 1.04 | $ 1.04 | $ 1.04 | $ 12,480.00
Egremont 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 5,200.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |Mirabito S 1.04|S 1.04|S 1.04 | S 8,840.00
Mt. Washington 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 5,200.00
Otis 8,400.00 [Mirabito S 1.04 | $ 1.04 | $ 1.04 [ $ 8,736.00
Sheffield 6,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 6,240.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04|S 1.04|S 1.04 | S 5,200.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.04 | S 1.04 | S 1.04 | $ 5,200.00
Total 57,900.00 $ 60,216.00




FY23-15 Option C Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 9,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 5,400.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 6,000.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 2,520.00
Florida 9,300.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 5,580.00
Mt. Greylock School District 300.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.60 | S 0.60 | S 060 | S 180.00
North Adams 2,500.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 1,500.00
Williamstown 19,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 11,400.00
Total 54,300.00 $ 32,580.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 18,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 10,800.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 6,000.00
Lenox 15,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 9,000.00
Peru 5,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 3,000.00
Pittsfield 60,500.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 36,300.00
Richmond 8,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 4,800.00
Washington 4,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 2,400.00
Windsor 10,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 6,000.00
Total 130,500.00 $ 78,300.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Alford 3,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 1,800.00
Becket 12,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 7,200.00
Egremont 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 3,000.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 5,100.00
Mt. Washington 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 3,000.00
Otis 8,400.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 5,040.00
Sheffield 6,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 3,600.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 3,000.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 060 | S 0.60 | S 0.60 | $ 3,000.00
Total 57,900.00 $ 34,740.00




FY23-15 Option D Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 9,000.00 [Mirabito S 133 (S 133 (S 1.33 [ $ 11,970.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 133 ]S 133 ]S 1.33 | $ 13,300.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 |Mirabito S 1.331]8S 1.331]8S 1.33|$ 5,586.00
Florida 9,300.00 |Mirabito S 133 ]S 133 ]S 1.33|$ 12,369.00
Mt. Greylock School District 300.00 |Mirabito S 1331]S 1.331]8S 1.331]8S 399.00
North Adams 2,500.00 |Mirabito S 133 ]S 133 ]S 133 |$ 3,325.00
Williamstown 19,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.331|8S 1.331]8S 1.33 | $ 25,270.00
Total 54,300.00 $ 72,219.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 18,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 $ 138 $ 1.38 | $ 24,840.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1381 S 1381 1.38 | $ 13,800.00
Lenox 15,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 S 138 $ 1.38 | $ 20,700.00
Peru 5,000.00 [Mirabito S 138 $ 138 |$ 138 |$ 6,900.00
Pittsfield 60,500.00 [Mirabito S 138 S 138 S 1.38 | $ 83,490.00
Richmond 8,000.00 [Mirabito S 138 $ 138 | $ 1.38 [ $ 11,040.00
Washington 4,000.00 [Mirabito S 138 S 138 S 138 |$ 5,520.00
Windsor 10,000.00 [Mirabito S 138 | $ 138 | $ 1.38 | $ 13,800.00
Total 130,500.00 $ 180,090.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Alford 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 S 138 S 138 |S$  4,140.00
Becket 12,000.00 [Mirabito S 138 $ 138 $ 1.38 | $ 16,560.00
Egremont 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 $ 138 $ 138 |$ 6,900.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |Mirabito S 1381 S 1381 1.38 | $ 11,730.00
Mt. Washington 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 S 138 S 138 |$  6,900.00
Otis 8,400.00 [Mirabito S 138 | $ 138 $ 1.38 | $ 11,592.00
Sheffield 6,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 S 138 S 138 |$ 8,280.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1381 1381 1.38 | $  6,900.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 138 S 138 S 138 |$ 6,900.00
Total 57,900.00 $ 79,902.00




FY23-16 Heating Oil




FY23-16 Heating Oil

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page [Non-Collusion Form
O'Connell Oil Associaties, inc. Yes Yes Yes
West Oil Company, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Mirabito Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: North Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Price
1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.60|$ 060|S 0.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lipton Energy S 039S 039S 0.39 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito S 0.36 | S 0.36 | S 0.32]$S 043 ]S 043 ]S 0.43
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Price
1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal.
0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.601|$ 0.60|S 0.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lipton Energy S 039S 039S 0.39 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito S 043 ]S 043 ]S 0.39]S 0.52 ]S 0.52 ]S 0.52
Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2022 NYMEX Price
1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. 1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal.
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.60|$ 060|S 0.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lipton Energy 5 039S 0.39 (S 0.39 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito 0.46 0.46 0.42 0.55 0.55 0.55




FY23-16 Option A Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 5,600.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 036 (S 036 (S 0.32 (S 1,792.00
Clarksburg 18,100.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 036 (S 036 (S 0.32|$ 5,792.00
Florida 15,300.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 036 (S 036 (S 0.32 | S 4,896.00
Mt. Greylock Regional High School 54,000.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 036 (S 0.36 (S 0.32 | $ 17,280.00
North Adams Public Schools 32,000.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 036 (S 036 (S 0.32 | $ 10,240.00
Williamstown 5,800.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 036 (S 0.36 (S 0.32|$ 1,856.00
Total 130,800.00 $ 41,856.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 3,000.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039S 039S 0.39|$ 1,170.00
Lanesborough 2,600.00 [Lipton Energy S 039 (S 039 (S 0.39 | $ 1,014.00
Pittsfield 7,200.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039S 039S 0.39 | $ 2,808.00
Richmond 33,600.00 [Lipton Energy $ 039 | $ 039 |$ 0.39 | $ 13,104.00
Windsor 2,500.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039S 039S 039S 975.00
Total 48,900.00 $ 19,071.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Alford 1,200.00 [Lipton Energy $ 039 | $ 039 |$ 039 |$  468.00
Egremont 1,800.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039S 039S 0.39|S$  702.00
Monterey 2,800.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039 | $ 039 |$ 0.39 | $ 1,092.00
Mt. Washington 4,000.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039S 039S 0.39 | $ 1,560.00
Otis 14,500.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039 | $ 039 |$ 0.39 | $ 5,655.00
Sheffield 8,900.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039 (S 039S 0.39 | $ 3,471.00
Tyringham 2,850.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039 | $ 039 |$ 039 |$ 1,111.50
West Stockbridge 8,000.00 |Lipton Energy $ 039S 039S 0.39 | $ 3,120.00
Total 44,050.00 $ 17,179.50




FY23-16 Option B Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 5,600.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 043 (S 043 (S 0.43 [ S 2,408.00
Clarksburg 18,100.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 043 (S 043 (S 0.43|$ 7,783.00
Florida 15,300.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 043 (S 043 (S 0.43 (S 6,579.00
Mt. Greylock Regional High School 54,000.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 043 (S 043 (S 0.43 | $ 23,220.00
North Adams Public Schools 32,000.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 043 (S 043 (S 0.43 | S 13,760.00
Williamstown 5,800.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 043 (S 043 (S 0.43 | $ 2,494.00
Total 130,800.00 $ 56,244.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 3,000.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 052 (S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 1,560.00
Lanesborough 2,600.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 052 (S 052 (S 0.52 | $ 1,352.00
Pittsfield 7,200.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 052 (S 052 (S 0.52 [ S 3,744.00
Richmond 33,600.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 052 (S 052 (S 0.52 | $ 17,472.00
Windsor 2,500.00 [Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 052 (S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 1,300.00
Total 48,900.00 $ 25,428.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Alford 1,200.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 | S 0.55 | S 0.55 (S  660.00
Egremont 1,800.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 (S 055 (S 0.55 (S 990.00
Monterey 2,800.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 | S 0.55 | S 0.55 | $ 1,540.00
Mt. Washington 4,000.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 | S 055 (S 0.55 [ $ 2,200.00
Otis 14,500.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. 5 0.55 | $ 0.55 | $ 0.55 | $ 7,975.00
Sheffield 8,900.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 | S 055 (S 0.55 [ S 4,895.00
Tyringham 2,850.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 | S 0.55 | S 0.55|$ 1,567.50
West Stockbridge 8,000.00 |Mirabito Holdings, Inc. S 0.55 | S 055 (S 0.55 [ S 4,400.00
Total 44,050.00 $ 24,227.50




FY23-17 Liquid Propane




FY23-17 Liquid Propane

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page |Non-Collusion Form
Mirabito Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Northern Berkshire County
Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito 1,800.00 | S 2.25(S 4,050.00
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito 15,300.00 | S 2.25(S 34,425.00
Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito 28,595.00 | S 2.25(S 64,338.75
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