FY24-01 Aggregates & Loam




FY24-01 Picked Up Products

Bidder Bid Signature Form _| Product Certification Form | Tax Compliance Form | Non-Collusion Form _| Addendum 1
Tonlino & Sons, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes Yes |ves Yes
Troy Sand & Gravel Co., Inc. Yes Yes Yes [ves Yes
Section 1: Picked Up Aggregates
product Units Estimated Volume Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
11/2" Minus Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 740.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 60.00 [ $ 27.00 [ ¢ 1,620.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,500.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 50.00 | § 27.00 | $ 1,350.00 | No Bid 0 Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 2,540.00 | 2175 |$ 55,245.00 19.50 49,530.00 | No Bid o Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,440.00 | No Bid o Bid 19.00 27,360.00 [ § 17.00 24,480.00
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 3,450.00 17.50 60,375.00 18.50 63,825.00 | § 17.00 58,650.00
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 2,800.00 16.20 45,360.00 18.50 51,800.00 | $ 16.00 44,800.00
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 4,300.00 14.90 64,070.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 2,850.00 14.50 41,325.00 [ § 1725 $ 49,162.50 | No Bid No Bid
1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Tons 2,300.00 13.50 31,050.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 230.00 16.20 3,726.00 | $ 2150 | $ 4,945.00 | $ 2500 | $ 5,750.00
Modified Rockfill Tons 100.00 18.95 1,895.00 [ § 2150 [ § 2,150.00 | No Bid No Bid




FY24-01 Delivered Products

Section 2a: Delivered Bids - Nort

Tonlino & Sons, LLC

h County

Trew Stone, LLC

Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc.

Product Units. Volume
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 95.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 4,465.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Tons 200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 170.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 7,480.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 100.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 4,400.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 90.00 | S 3875 | S 3,487.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 40.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S 34.00 | No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 140.00 | $ 3450 | $ 4,830.00 | No Bid No Bid S 34.00 | No Bid
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 150.00 | $ 3450 | $ 5,175.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 200.00 | $ 3250 | $ 6,500.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 600.00 | $ 3150 | $ 18,900.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 45.00 | $ 3450 | $ 1,552.50 | No Bid No Bid S 34.00 | No Bid
Dumped Rip Rap Tons 100.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section 2b: Delivered Bids - Central County
Product Units Volume Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
3/4" Screened Gravel Cubic Yards 500.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Loam Cubic Yards 500.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 20,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 100.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Reclaimed Pavement (Hardpack) Cubic Yards 200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Washed Gravel Stone Tons 50.00 [ $ 3750 | $ 1,875.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 200.00 | $ 29.25 | $ 5,850.00 | No Bid No Bid $ 28.00 [ 5,600.00
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 400.00 | $ 28.05 | $ 11,220.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,000.00 | $ 27.75 [ $ 27,750.00 | No Bid No Bid S 28.00 | $ 28,000.00
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,450.00 | $ 27.15 | $ 39,367.50 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 90.00 | $ 28.05 | $ 2,524.50 | No Bid No Bid S 34.00 [ $ 3,060.00
Section 2c: Delivered Bids - South County
Product Units Volume Tonlino & Sons, LLC Trew Stone, LLC Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value Bid Price Bid Value
11/2" Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 1,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1" Minus Crushed Gravel Cubic Yards 500.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/8" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 900.00 3530 [ S 31,770.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 250.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 1,300.00 | $ 2950 | $ 38,350.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Crushed Stone (Traprock) Tons 900.00 | $ 2825 (S 25,425.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3/4" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,500.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 42,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11/2" Dense Graded Crushed Stone Tons 1,200.00 | $ 27.50 | $ 33,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1/2" Minus Traprock Gravel Tons 500.00 | S 26.00 | S 13,000.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Rip Rap 6" Max Tons 200.00 | $ 2850 | $ 5,700.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Modified Rockfill Tons 100.00 | $ 3250 [ $ 3,250.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




FY24-02 Cold Patch




FY24-02 Cold Patch

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form | Non-Collusion Form | Addendum 1
B. Metcalf Asphalt Paving, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
WhiteCap, L.P. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Picked Up Products
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Value
B. Metcalf Asphalt Paving, Inc. No Bid 253| No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. No Bid 253 No Bid No Bid
WhiteCap, L.P. No Bid 253| No Bid No Bid
Trew Stone, LLC duraPATCH 253| $ 141.00 | S 35,673.00
Section 2a: Delivered Product - North County
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
B. Metcalf Asphalt Paving, Inc. Gempatch 6|S 695.00 | No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 6[ S 840.00 | No Bid
WhiteCap, L.P. Max - A - Patch, ACP 6| S 670.00 | S 4,020.00
Trew Stone, LLC No Bid 6| No Bid No Bid
Section 2b: Delivered Product - Central County
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
B. Metcalf Asphalt Paving, Inc. Gempatch 3]s 695.00 | S 2,085.00
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 3[s 840.00 | $§ 2,520.00
WhiteCap, L.P. Max - A - Patch, ACP 3| S 670.00 | S 2,010.00
Trew Stone, LLC No Bid 3|No Bid No Bid
Section 2c: Delivered Product - South County
Bidder Type of High-Performance Cold Patch Estimated Pallets Bid Price Bid Value
B. Metcalf Asphalt Paving, Inc. Gempatch 15| $ 695.00 | S 10,425.00
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. ProPatch 15| $ 840.00 | § 12,600.00
WhiteCap, L.P. Max - A - Patch, ACP 15| S 670.00 | S 10,050.00
Trew Stone, LLC No Bid 15(No Bid No Bid




FY24-03 Calcium & Magnesium
Chloride




FY24-03 Calcium & Magnesium Chloride

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax C e Form Non-Coll Form Addendum 1
All States Construction, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1a: Delivered as a Liquid - North County
Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - M. Chloride Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price | Bid Value
All States Construction, Inc. 5,000.00 | $ 129 | $ 6,450.00 6,000.00 | No Bid No Bid - NA NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 5,000.00 | $ 126 | S 6,300.00 6,000.00 | $ 1.15 [ $ 6,900.00 - NA NA
Section 1b: Delivered as a Liquid - Central County
Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - M. Chloride Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price | Bid Value
All States Construction, Inc. 10,000.00 | $ 129 [ $ 12,900.00 15,000.00 | No Bid No Bid - NA NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,000.00 | $ 126 | S 12,600.00 15,000.00 | $ 1.15 | $ 17,250.00 - NA NA
Section 1c: Delivered as a Liquid - South County
Bidder Estimated Gallons - Calcium Chloride Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons - M. Chloride Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons - Safe Bind 30/70 Bid Price | Bid Value
All States Construction, Inc. 10,000.00 | $ 129 [ $ 12,900.00 14,500.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 10,000.00 | $ 126 | S 12,600.00 14,500.00 | $ 1.15 | $ 16,675.00 10,000.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2: Products Delivered in 50lbs. Bags
Bidder - Calcium Chloride Estimated Bags - North County Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Bags - Central County Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Bags - South County Bid Price | Bid Value
All States Construction, Inc. - NA No Bid 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - NA NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. - NA No Bid 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - NA NA
Section 2 Products Delivered in 50lbs Bags
Bidder -M. Chloride Estimated Bags - North County Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Bags - Central County Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Bags - South County Bid Price | Bid Value
All States Construction, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - NA NA - NA NA
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid - NA NA - NA NA




FY24-04 Culvert Products




FY24-04 Culvert Products

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form | Non-Collusion Form Addendum 1
Core & Main, L.P. Yes Yes Yes Yes
EJ Prescott, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes

Section 1: Single Wall

Corrugated Polyethylen:

e Culvert Piping - South County

Core & Main, L.P.

EJ Prescott, Inc.

Product Estimated Feet of Piping
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
15" Solid 12000 | $ 16.07 | $ 1,928.40 | $ 1535 | % 1,842.00
18" Solid 12000 | $ 2290 (% 2,748.00 | $ 22453 2,694.00
24" Solid 80.00 [ $ 3453 [$ 2,762.40 | $ 3390 ($ 2,712.00
Section 2a: Double Wall Corrugated Culvert Piping - North County
Product Estimated Feet of Piping Core & Main, L.P. EJ Prescott, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
6" Solid 100.00 | $ 526 |3 526.00 | $ 530|% 530.00
10" Solid 100.00 | $ 1186 |3 1,186.00 | $ 1195|$ 1,195.00
12" Solid 400.00 | $ 1187 |3 4,748.00 | $ 12003 4,800.00
15" Solid 380.00 | $ 1528 | $ 5,806.40 | $ 1535 | % 5,833.00
18" Solid 437.00 | $ 2289 [ $ 10,002.93 | $ 2310 (% 10,094.70
24" Solid 270.00 | $ 3455 (¢ 9,328.50 | $ 3470 [ $ 9,369.00
Section 2b: Double Wall Corrugated Polyethylene Culvert Piping - Central County
Product Estimated Feet of Piping Core & Main, L.P. EJ Prescott, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
10" Solid 40.00 | $ 1186 |3 47440 | $ 1195|$ 478.00
12" Solid 12000 [ $ 1187 |3 1,424.40 | $ 12003 1,440.00
15" Solid 360.00 | $ 1528 | $ 5,500.80 | $ 1535 | % 5,526.00
18" Solid 1,080.00 | $ 2289 [ $ 24,721.20 | $ 2310 % 24,948.00
24" Solid 500.00 | $ 3455 [$ 17,275.00 | $ 3470 | $ 17,350.00
30" Solid 200.00 | $ 5553 [ $ 11,106.00 | $ 5565 [ $ 11,130.00
36" Solid 100.00 | $ 68.85 [ $ 6,885.00 | $ 69.15 [ $ 6,915.00
Section 2c: Double Wall Corrugated Culvert Piping - South County
Product Estimated Feet of Piping Core & Main, L.P. EJ Prescott, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
12" Solid 380.00 [ $ 1187 |3 4,510.60 | $ 12003 4,560.00
12" perforated 100.00 | $ 1187 |3 1,187.00 | $ 12003 1,200.00
15" Solid 1,100.00 [ $ 1528 | $ 16,808.00 | $ 1535 | % 16,885.00
18" Solid 530.00 | $ 2289 [ $ 12,131.70 | $ 2310 % 12,243.00
24" Solid 300.00 | $ 3455 [$ 10,365.00 | $ 3470 | $ 10,410.00
30" Solid 160.00 | $ 5543 [ $ 8,868.80 | $ 5565 [ $ 8,904.00
36" Solid 100.00 | $ 68.85 | $ 6,885.00 | $ 69.15 | $ 6,915.00
48" Solid 160.00 | $ 107.96 [ $ 17,273.60 109.55] $ 17,528.00
Section 3: Single Wall Culvert Couplings - South County
Product Estimated Number of Couplings ___ Core & Mal'": LP. __ EJ Prescotf, Inc.
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
15" Split 6.00|$ 2432 (S 14592 [ $ 24.00 [ $ 144.00
18" Split 6.00|$ 4314 | $ 258.84 [ 42.00|$ 252.00
24" Split 6.00|$ 60.84 | $ 365.04 [ $ 60.00 | $ 360.00
Section 4a: Double Wall Culvert Couplings - North County
N N Core & Main, L.P. EJ Prescott, Inc.
Product Estimated Number of Couplings —— — —— —
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
12" Split 4.00|$ 1520 | $ 60.80 [ $ 15.00 | $ 60.00
12" Watertight 4.00|$ 12422 [ $ 496.88 | $ 120.00 | $ 480.00
15" Split 4.00|$ 2532 ($ 101.28 [ $ 25.00 [ $ 100.00
15" Watertight 4.00|$ 183.99 [ $ 735.96 [ $ 175.00 [ $ 700.00
18" Split 6.00|$ 4314 | $ 258.84 [ 42.00|$ 252.00
18" Watertight 4.00]$ 32440 [ $ 1,297.60 | $ 305.00 [ $ 1,220.00
Section 4b: Double Wall Culvert Couplings - Central County
N N Core & Main, L.P. EJ Prescott, Inc.
Product Estimated Number of Couplings —— — —— —
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
15" Split 110.00 | $ 2532 ($ 2,785.20 | $ 25.00 [ $ 2,750.00
18" Split 202.00 | $ 4314 | $ 8,714.28 | $ 42.00 ]S 8,484.00
Section 4c: Double Wall Culvert Couplings - South County
N N Core & Main, L.P. EJ Prescott, Inc.
Product Estimated Number of Couplings —— — —— —
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total
12" Split 6.00 | $ 1520 | $ 9120 [ $ 15.00 | $ 90.00
15" Split 16.00 | $ 2532 ($ 405.12 | $ 25.00($ 400.00
18" Split 6.00 | $ 4314 | $ 258.84 | 42.00|$ 252.00
24" Split 200]$ 60.84 | $ 12168 [ $ 60.00 | $ 120.00




FY24-05 Guard Rail Products




FY24-05 Guardrail Products

Bidder Bid Signature Page |Tax Compliance |Non-Collusion Form |% Discount for Pick-Up |Bid Signature Page |Addendum 1
Guardrail Solutions, LLC Yes Yes Yes 5%]|Yes Yes
Premier Fence, LLC Yes Yes Yes 1.5%|Yes Yes
3 Guardrail Solutions, LLC Premier Fence, LLC
Product Quantity - - - - - -
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total

Straight Rail Sections, Galvanized Steel, 12'6" (Each) 47 | S 150.00 | S 7,050.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 11,750.00
Curved Rail Sections, Galvanized Steel, 12'6" (Each) 10(S 160.00 | S 1,600.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 3,000.00
Steel Terminal Ends (Each) 16| S 60.00 | S 960.00 | $ 150.00 | S 2,400.00
Steel Post, "H" Section, Galvanized Steel, 6' (Each) 113 | $ 100.00 | S 11,300.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 14,125.00
Deep Steel Post, "H" Section, Galvanized Steel, 8' (Each) 8|S 125.00 | S 1,000.00 | $ 200.00 | S 1,600.00
Splice Bolts, 1 1/2", 100 Pack (Each) 3(S 60.00 | S 180.00 | S 150.00 | $ 450.00
Post Bolts, 2", 100 Pack (Each) 118 70.00 | S 70.00 | S 250.00 | $ 250.00
Post Bolts, 9 1/2", 100 Pack (Each) 118 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 400.00
Round Washers, Galvanized Steel, 100 Pack (Each) 3(S 120.00 | S 360.00 | S 75.00 | S 225.00

Hex Nuts, Galvanized Steel, 100 Pack (Each) 3(S 135.00 | S 405.00 | $ 100.00 | S 300.00
Reflectors, White-Yellow (Each) 20| S 9.00 | $ 180.00 | S 10.00 | $ 200.00
Delineator Posts, Red-Green (Each) 9(S 65.00 | S 585.00 | S 60.00 | S 540.00
Total S 24,090.00 S 34,200.00




FY24-06 Guard Rail Installed




FY24-06 Guardrail Installed

Bidder Bid Signature Form |Tax Compliance Form |Non Collusion Form |Debarment Form |OSHA Form Mass Prequal |Bid Bond |Addendum 1
Guardrail Solutions, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Premier Fence, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
5 Guardrail Solutions, LLC Premier Fence, LLC
Product Quantity — - — -
Bid Price Total Bid Bid Price Total Bid

Standard Guard Straight, Steel Posts, 6'3" Post Spacing (Feet) 1,750 | S 32.00 | $ 56,000.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 66,500.00

Standard Guard Straight, Deep Steel Posts, 6'3" Post Spacing (Feet) 220 | S 38.00 | $ 8,360.00 | $ 40.00 [ $  8,800.00

Standard Guard Straight, Deep Steel Posts, 12'6" Post Spacing (Feet) 214 | $ 34.00 | $ 7,276.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 8,132.00

Standard Steel Curved, Steel Posts, 6'3" Post Spacing (Feet) 200 | $ 31.00 | $ 6,200.00 | $ 41.00 [ S  8,200.00

Standard Steel Curved, Deep Steel Posts, 6'3" Post Spacing (Feet) 175 | $ 38.00 | $ 6,650.00 | $ 47.00 [ S  8,225.00

Standard Steel Curved, Deep Steel Posts, 12'6" Post Spacing (Feet) 17| S 34.00 | $ 578.00 | $ 42.00 [ $ 714.00

Standard Steel Straight, Wood Posts (Feet) 320 (S 32.00 | $ 10,240.00 | $ 40.00 [ $ 12,800.00

Standard Steel Terminal Ends (Each) 25| S 75.00 | $ 1,875.00 | $ 250.00 [ S  6,250.00

Removal of Existing Concrete Posts (Each) 300 | $ 10.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 8.00 | $  2,400.00

620.12 - Guardrail, Straight, TL-2, Single-Faced (Feet) 1,700 | S 31.00 | $ 52,700.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 62,900.00

620.13 - Guardrail, Straight, TL-3, Single-Faced (Feet) 800 | S 32.00 | $ 25,600.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 30,400.00

620.321 - Guardrail, Curved, TL-2, Deep Posts, Single-Faced (Feet) 400 | S 34.00 | $ 13,600.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 15,600.00

620.33 - Guardrail, Curved, TL-3, Deep Posts, Single-Faced (Feet) 163 | $ 38.00 | $ 6,194.00 | $ 4400 (S 7,172.00

627.82 - Guardrail Tangent End Treatment, TL-2 (Each) 10(S 4,950.00 | S 49,500.00 | $ 5,475.00 [ S 54,750.00

627.83 - Guardrail Tangent End Treatment, TL-3 (Each) 118 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 5,860.00 [ $  5,860.00

Total S 251,573.00 $ 298,703.00




FY24-07 Line Painting




FY24-07 Line Painting

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form OSHA Form Debarment Form Mass Prequal |Bid Bond |Addendum 1
K5 Corporation Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Markings, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

K5 Corporation

Markings, Inc.

Product Quantity - - -
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total

Thermoplastic 4" White Reflectorized (Feet) 16,800 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.500 | $ 8,400.000
Thermoplastic 4" Yellow Reflectorized (Feet) 180,000 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.500 | $ 90,000.000
Thermoplastic 12" White for Crosswalks/Stopbars (Square Feet) 7,500 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 3.250 | $ 24,375.000
Waterborne 4" White (Feet) 1,230,695 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.090 | S 110,762.550
Waterborne 4" Yellow (Feet) 2,790,296 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.090 | S 251,126.640
Waterborne 12" White for Crosswalks/Stopbars (Square Feet) 31,000 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.750 | $ 23,250.000
Waterborne 4" White for Parking Lines (Feet) 28,500 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.420 | $ 11,970.000
Waterborne White Directional Arrow (Each) 85 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 34.950 | S 2,970.750
Waterborne White Bicycle (Each) 20 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 29.850 | $§ 597.000
Chlorinated 4" White (Feet) 28,100 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.090 | S 2,529.000
Chlorinated 4" Yellow (Feet) 468,828 | Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 0.090 | S 42,194.520
Total Bid Bid Rejected Bid Rejected S 568,175.460
Lead Time Bid Rejected Bid Rejected 1 Week

Min. Order for Line Painting Bid Rejected Bid Rejected 2500 LF

Min. Order for Parking/Crosswalks Bid Rejected Bid Rejected 2500 SF




FY24-08 Road Crack Sealing




FY24-08 Crack Sealing

Bidder

Bid Signature Page

Tax Compliance Form

Non Collusion Form

Debarment Form

OSHA Form

Bid Bond

Mass Prequal

Addendum 1

Sealcoating Inc. DBA Indus

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Sealcoating, Inc. DBA Indus

Product Quantity - - -
Bid Price Total Bid
PG & Fiber 25,000 | S 12.44 | S 311,000.00
PCRM 60,200 | S 14.06 | S 846,412.00
Rubber 500 24.22| S 12,110.00




FY24-09 Stone Seal




FY24-09 Stone Seal

Bidder Bid Signature Page |Tax Compliance Form |Non-Collusion Form |Debarment Form |Bid Bond |Mass Prequalification |OSHA Form [Addendum 1
All States Construction, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Lee
All States Asphalt, Inc.
Product Quantity - - ates opha nf:
Bid Price Bid Total
Old Work 2,000 | No Bid No Bid
Stockbridge
. All States Asphalt, Inc.
Product Quantity - - -
Bid Price Bid Total
Old Work 17,000 | S 4.05|S 68,850.00
West Stockbridge
All States Asphalt, Inc.
Product Quantity - - ates opha nf:
Bid Price Bid Total
Old Work 26,000 | S 390 | S 101,400.00




FY24-10 Hot Mix Asphalt




FY24-10 Hot Mix Asphalt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Form Non-Collusion Form Debarment Statement OSHA Certification Addendeum 1 Add: 2

Century Aggregates, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Trew Stone, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Eurovia Atlantic Coast LLC, DBA| Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Product Tons Picked Up Century Aggregates, Inc. Trew Stone, LLC Eurovia Atlantic Coast, LLC DBA Northeast Paving
Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total Bid Price Bid Total

MassDOT Berm 230 | No Bid No Bid S 88.00 | $ 20,240.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 28,750.00
MassDOT Dense Top 1,930 [ No Bid No Bid S 88.00 | $ 169,840.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 183,350.00
MassDOT Top 7,735 [ $ 78.00 | $ 603,330.00 | S 88.00 | $ 680,680.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 696,150.00
MassDOT Binder 2,900 | $ 72.00 | $ 208,800.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 255,200.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 261,000.00

Note two bidders are awarded each county section for this bid.




FY24-10A Paving




FY23-10A Paving

Bidder Bid Form Bid Signature Form |Tax Compliance Certification Non-Collusion Certificate Debarment Statement | OSHA Certification |Bid Bond [Addendum 1 |Addendum 2
LB Corporation Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Palmer Paving Corporation Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Northern Berkshire County
Product Quantity i : LB Corporation i .Paln.ler Paving Corporation i
Bid Price Total Bid Bid Price Total Bid
Milling (Square Yards) 12,995 [ $ 7.00 | $ 90,965.00 | S 375|$ 48,731.25
MassDOT Surface Course (Tons Applied in Place)
Pavement Mill & Fill 1,550 | $ 131.00 | $ 203,050.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 193,750.00
Aspahlt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 907 | $ 8.00 | S 7,256.00 | S 9.00 | $ 8,163.00
Road Reclamation with Calcium Chloride (Square
Yards) 3,000 | $ 6.10 | S 18,300.00 | $ 835|S 25,050.00
MassDOT Binder Course (Tons Applied in Place) 510 | $ 128.00 | $ 65,280.00 | S 123.00 | $ 62,730.00
Full Depth Reclamation MassDOT Surface Course (Tons Applied in Place)
260 | $ 131.00 | $ 34,060.00 | S 155.00 | $ 40,300.00
Aspahlt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 100 | $ 8.00 | S 800.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 2,200.00
Adjust Sttucture (Each) 47 [ $ 850.00 | $ 39,950.00 | S 375.00 | $ 17,625.00
Adjust Valve Box (Each) 21| S 450.00 | $ 9,450.00 | S 250.00 | $ 5,250.00
HMA berm with Fiber, Type A (Linear Feet Applied in
Additional ltems Place) 6,476 | $ 9.00 | $ 58,284.00 | $ 715 | S 46,303.40
Sidewalk (Tons) 791 240.00 | $ 18,960.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 18,960.00
Excavation (Cubic Yards) 159 [ $ 69.00 | S 10,971.00 | $ 93.00 | 14,787.00
Gravel for Sidewalk (Cubic Yards) 159 [ $ 70.00 | 11,130.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 18,285.00
Sidewalk Aprons (Each) 5118 450.00 | $ 22,950.00 | S 675.00 | $ 34,425.00
Total Bid S 591,406.00 S 536,559.65
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Product Quantity i : LB Corporation i .Paln.ler Paving Corporation i
Bid Price Total Bid Bid Price Total Bid
MassDOT Leveling Course (Tons Applied in Place)
2200 3 131.00 S 288,200.00 s AT S 268,400.00
Pavement Overlay Asphalt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 800 |5 8.00 S 6,400.00 s i S 9,280.00
Milling (Square Yards) 3,500 | $ 8.00 | $ 28,000.00 | S 575|$ 20,125.00
MassDOT Leveling Course (Tons Applied in Place)
150 [ $ 165.00 | $ 24,750.00 | S 132.00 | $ 19,800.00
Pavement Mill & Fill MassDOT Surface Course (Tons Applied in Place)
2,000 | $ 131.00 | $ 262,000.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 240,000.00
Aspahlt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 500 | $ 8.00 | S 4,000.00 | S 7.90 | S 3,950.00
Additional Items Adjust Sttucture (Each) 20 850.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 375.00 | S 750.00
Total Bid S 615,050.00 S 562,305.00
Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Product Quantity i : LB Corporation i .Paln.ler Paving Corporation i
Bid Price Total Bid Bid Price Total Bid
MassDOT Surface Course (Tons Applied in Place)
9,200 | $ 130.00 | $ 1,196,000.00 | $ 122.00 | $ 1,122,400.00
Pavement Overlay MassDOT Leveling Course (Tons Applied in Place)
2,000 | $ 128.00 | $ 256,000.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 264,000.00
Aspahlt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 8,200 | $ 8.00 | $ 65,600.00 | $ 825|S 67,650.00
Milling (Square Yards) 13,500 | $ 6.00 | $ 81,000.00 | S 350 | S 47,250.00




MassDOT Surface Course (Tons Applied in Place)

Pavement Mill & Fill 1,425 131.00 186,675.00 125.00 178,125.00
Aspahlt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 550 8.00 4,400.00 11.35 6,242.50
Road Reclamation with Calcium Chloride (Square
Yards) 9,000 5.20 46,800.00 4.50 40,500.00
MassDOT Binder Course (Tons Applied in Place) 1,000 124.00 124,000.00 110.00 110,000.00
Full Depth Reclamation MassDOT Surface Course (Tons Applied in Place)
1,000 131.00 131,000.00 119.00 119,000.00
Aspahlt Emulsion for Tack Coat (Gallons Applied in
Place) 400 8.00 3,200.00 9.50 3,800.00
Dense Graded Crushed Stone for Shoulders (Cubic
Yards Compacted in Place) 300 75.00 22,500.00 111.00 33,300.00
Additional Items Adjust Structure (Each) 37 850.00 31,450.00 375.00 13,875.00
HMA Berm with Fiber, Type A (Linear Feet Applied in
Place) 800 10.00 8,000.00 12.00 9,600.00
Total Bid 2,156,625.00 2,015,742.50




FY24-11 Winter Rock Salt




FY24-11 Winter Rock Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page [Product Certification Form Tax Compliance Form [Non-Collusion Form |Bid Bond |Addendum 1 |Addendum 2 |Addendum 3
Eastern Minerals, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Delivered - North County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 9,560.00 | S 79.05 | S 755,718.00
Apalachee, LLC 9,560.00 | S 81.00 | S 774,360.00
Morton Salt, Inc. 9,560.00 | $ 88.82 | S 849,119.20
Section 2: Delivered - Central County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 10,700.00 | S 7599 | S 813,093.00
Apalachee, LLC 10,700.00 | S 78.00 | S 834,600.00
Morton Salt, Inc. 10,700.00 | $ 86.33 | S 923,731.00
Section 3: Delivered - South County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 11,700.00 | S 78.00 | S 912,600.00
Apalachee, LLC 11,700.00 | S 78.00 | S 912,600.00
Morton Salt, Inc. 11,700.00 | $ 88.31 (S 1,033,227.00
Section 4: Picked Up
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Eastern Minerals, Inc. 300.00 | S 75.90 | § 22,770.00
Apalachee, LLC 300.00 | S 73.00 | S 21,900.00
Morton Salt, Inc. 300.00 | S 86.00 | S 25,800.00




FY24-12 Winter Sand




FY24-12 Winter Sand

Bidder Bid Signature Page |Product Certification Form [Tax Compliance Form [Non-Collusion Form |Bid Bond [Addendum1 |Addendum 3
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Regular Winter Sand Delivered
North County Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, Inc. 440.00 | S 35.00 | $ 15,400.00 7,000.00 | $ 35.00 [ $ 245,000.00 900.00 | S 35.00 | S 31,500.00
Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc. 440.00 | No Bid No Bid 7,000.00 [ S 32.00 [ S 224,000.00 900.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 1.2 Regular Winter Sand Picked Up
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 50.00 | $ 28.00 | S 1,400.00
Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc. 50.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2.1 Coarse Winter Sand Delivered
North County Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 950.00 | S 35.00 | $ 33,250.00 2,300.00 | $ 35.00 [$ 80,500.00 1,900.00 | S 35.00 | S 66,500.00
Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc. 950.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,300.00 | S 32.00|S$ 73,600.00 1,900.00 | No Bid No Bid
Section 2.2 Coarse Winter Sand Picked Up
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 400.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 14,000.00
Troy Sand and Gravel Co, Inc. 400.00 | No Bid No Bid




FY24-13 Treated Winter Sand




FY24-13 Treated Winter Salt

Bidder Bid Signature Page Product Certification Form |Tax Compliance Form [Non-Collusion Form ([Bid Bond |Addendum1 [Addendum 3
Apalachee, LLC Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Cargill, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Morton Salt, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1.1 50% Magnesium Chloride and 50% Distiller Soluble; Delivered as a Liquid

Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Gallons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 5,400.00 | No Bid No Bid 4,500.00 | No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 5,400.00 | No Bid No Bid 4,500.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 5,400.00 | No BId No Bld 4,500.00 | No BId No Bld
|Morton Salt, Inc. 5,400.00 | No Bid No Bid 4,500.00 | No Bid No Bid

Section 1.2 50% Magnesium Chloride and 50% Distiller Soluble; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered

Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 6,000.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 618,000.00 1,100.00 | $ 103.00 | S 113,300.00
Cargill, Inc. 6,000.00 | $ 11132 | $ 667,920.00 1,100.00 | $ 111.32 | $ 122,452.00
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 6,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 1,100.00 | No Bid No Bid
|Morton Salt, Inc. 6,000.00 | No Bid No Bld 1,100.00 | No Bid No Bld

Section 2.1 80% Liquid Magnesium Chloride and 20% Molasses; Delivered as a Liquid

Central County South County
Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Gallons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 2,050.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,600.00 | No Bid No Bid
Cargill, Inc. 2,050.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,600.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 2,050.00 | $ 168 (S 3,444.00 10,600.00 | S 1.68 S 17,808.00
|Morton Salt, Inc. 2,050.00 | No Bid No Bid 10,600.00 | No Bid No Bid

Section 2.2 80% Liquid Magnesium Chloride and 20% Molasses; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delivered

North County

Central County

South County

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total Estimated Tons Bid Price | Bid Total
Apalachee, LLC 2,350.00 | $ 103.00 | $ 242,050.00 1,000.00 | $ 101.00 | S 101,000.00 2,050.00 | S 101.00 [ $ 207,050.00
Cargill, Inc. 2,350.00 | No Bid No Bid 1,000.00 | No Bid No Bid 2,050.00 | No Bid No Bid
Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 2,350.00 | No Bld No Bld 1,000.00 | No BId No Bld 2,050.00 | No BId No Bld
|Morton Salt, Inc. 2,350.00 | $ 103.82 | $ 243,977.00 1,000.00 | $ 104.33 | $ 104,330.00 2,050.00 | $ 103.31 [ $ 211,785.50

ttion 3.2 60% Liquid Calcium and 40% O

rganic based Performance Enhancer; Mixed with Crushed Rock Salt and Delive

Central County

Bidder Estimated Tons Bid Price Bid Total

Apalachee, LLC 100.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 10,500.00
Cargill, Inc. 100.00 | No Bid No Bid

Innovative Municipal Products, Inc. 100.00 | No Bld No Bld

|Morton Salt, Inc. 100.00 | No Bid No Bid




FY24-14 Gasoline




FY24-14 Gasoline

Bidder Name

Bid Signature Page

Tax Compliance Page

Non-Collusion Form

O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Section 1: North Berkshire County

Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline

Bidder
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value
0'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 3,000.00 | $ 041 |S 1,230.00
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
. Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline
Bidder
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value
0O'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 174,000.00 | S 041 ]S 71,340.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Bidder Minimum 87 Octane Gasoline Minimum 89 Octane Gasoline Minimum 93 Octane Gasoline
Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Value Estimated Gallons Bid Price | Bid Value Estimated Gallons Bid Price | Bid Value
Q'Connell Oil Associaties, Inc. 47,200.00 | S 041 ]S 19,352.00 3,800.00 | $ 0.41 [ $ 1,558.00 2,500.00 | $ 0.41 [ $ 1,025.00




FY24-15 Diesel




FY24-15 Diesel Fuel

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page Non-Collusion Form
0'Connell Ol inc.__|Yes Yes Yes
West Oil Company, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Mirabito Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: North Berkshire Count;
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2023 NYMEX Pri Option C: Winterized Diesel / November 1 through March 31 Option D: Fixed Price Futures Winter Diesel / November 1 through Marcuh 31
1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
0'Connell Ol Associates, Inc. | $ 0380 | $ 0380 [ $ 0.380 | No Bid No Bid No Bid s 0380 | $ 0380 [ $ 0.380 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. s 0580 | $ 0580 | $ 0580 0930 [ § 0.930 [ § 0930 $ 0580 | $ 0580 | $ 0580 0930 [ § 0.930 [ § 0.930
Mirabito s 0.564 | § 0564 | $ 0564 | $ 1129 [ § 1129 [ § 1129 [ § 0.864 | 0.864 | $ 0.864 | 1429 $ 1.429 [ 1429
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2023 NYMEX Price Option C: Winterized Diesel / 1 through March 31 Option D: Fixed Price Futures Winter Diesel / 1 through Marcuh 31
1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gall. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc.__| $ 0500 | § 0500 | § 0.500 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 0500 | 0500 | § 0.500 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito $ 0.564 | 0564 | $ 0564 1129 [ 1129 § 1129 [ 0864 | 0.864 | S 0.864 1429 [ 1429 § 1.429
Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2023 NYMEX Price Option C: Winterized Diesel / November 1 through March 31 Option D: Fixed Price Futures Winter Diesel / November 1 through Marcuh 31
1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 -2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal.
0'Connell Ol Associates, Inc. | $ 0520 | $ 0520 | $ 0.520 | No Bid No Bid No Bid s 0520 | $ 0520 [ $ 0.520 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Mirabito s 0.564 | § 0564 | $ 0564 | $ 1129 [ § 1129 | $ 1129 [ § 0.864 | 0.864 | $ 0.864 | 1429 [ § 1429 | § 1.429




FY24-15 Option A Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 9,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 3,420.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 3,800.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 [0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 [ $ 1,596.00
Mt. Greylock Regional School District 350.00 |0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 133.00
Williamstown 1,900.00 |0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 722.00
Total 25,450.00 $ 25,450.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 18,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 9,000.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 5,000.00
Lenox 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 5,000.00
Peru 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 2,500.00
Pittsfield 60,000.00 [O'Connell Qil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 30,000.00
Richmond 8,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 4,000.00
Washington 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 2,500.00
Windsor 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 5,000.00
Total 126,000.00 $ 63,000.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value

Alford 3,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 1,560.00
Becket 12,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 6,240.00
Egremont 5,200.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,704.00
Great Barrington 8,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 4,160.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 | $ 4,420.00
Mt. Washington 4,500.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,340.00
Otis 8,400.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 4,368.00
Sheffield 6,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 3,120.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,600.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,600.00
Total 65,600.00 34,112.00




FY24-15 Option B Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire Count:
Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001 - 2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value
Adams 9,000.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0.930 | S 8,370.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0930 (S 9,300.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0.930 | S  3,906.00
Mt. Greylock Regional School District 350.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | S 0.930 | $ 0930 (S 325.50
Williamstown 1,900.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0.930 | S 1,767.00
Total 25,450.00 $ 25,450.00
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value
Dalton 18,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 20,322.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 11,290.00
Lenox 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 11,290.00
Peru 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 [ $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 [ $  5,645.00
Pittsfield 60,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 67,740.00
Richmond 8,000.00 |Mirabito $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1129 [ $  9,032.00
Washington 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $  5,645.00
Windsor 10,000.00 [Mirabito $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 [ $ 11,290.00
Total 126,000.00 $ 142,254.00
Section 3: Southern Berkshire Count
Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value
Alford 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $  3,387.00
Becket 12,000.00 [Mirabito $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 [ $ 13,548.00
Egremont 5,200.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 5,870.80
Great Barrington 8,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 9,032.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $  9,596.50
Mt. Washington 4,500.00 [Mirabito S 1.129 [ $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 [ $  5,080.50
Otis 8,400.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $  9,483.60
Sheffield 6,000.00 |Mirabito $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1129 [ $  6,774.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 | $  5,645.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.129 [ $ 1.129 | $ 1.129 [ $  5,645.00
Total 65,600.00 74,062.40




FY24-15 Option C Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Adams 9,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 3,420.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 3,800.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 [0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 [ $ 1,596.00
Mt. Greylock Regional School District 350.00 |0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 133.00
Williamstown 1,900.00 |0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 0.380 | $ 722.00
Total 25,450.00 $ 25,450.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 18,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 9,000.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 5,000.00
Lenox 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 5,000.00
Peru 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 2,500.00
Pittsfield 60,000.00 [0'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 30,000.00
Richmond 8,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 4,000.00
Washington 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 2,500.00
Windsor 10,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.50 | $ 0.50 | $ 0.50 [ $ 5,000.00
Total 126,000.00 $ 63,000.00

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+gal. | Bid Value

Alford 3,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 1,560.00
Becket 12,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 6,240.00
Egremont 5,200.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,704.00
Great Barrington 8,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 4,160.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 4,420.00
Mt. Washington 4,500.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,340.00
Otis 8,400.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 4,368.00
Sheffield 6,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 3,120.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | S 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,600.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 [O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.52 | $ 052 (S 0.52 [ $ 2,600.00
Total 65,600.00 34,112.00




FY24-15 Option D Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire Count:
Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001 -2,500 gal. 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value
Adams 9,000.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0.930 | S 8,370.00
Cheshire 10,000.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0930 | $ 0.930 [ $ 0930 (S 9,300.00
Clarksburg 4,200.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0.930 | S  3,906.00
Mt. Greylock Regional School District 350.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | S 0.930 | $ 0930 (S 325.50
Williamstown 1,900.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.930 | $ 0.930 | $ 0.930 | S 1,767.00
Total 25,450.00 $ 25,450.00
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. [ Bid Value
Dalton 18,000.00 |Mirabito S 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 25,722.00
Lanesborough 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 14,290.00
Lenox 10,000.00 |Mirabito S 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 14,290.00
Peru 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 [ $ 1.429 | $ 1429 [ $  7,145.00
Pittsfield 60,000.00 |Mirabito S 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 85,740.00
Richmond 8,000.00 |Mirabito $ 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1429 [ $ 11,432.00
Washington 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $  7,145.00
Windsor 10,000.00 [Mirabito $ 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 14,290.00
Total 126,000.00 $ 180,054.00
Section 3: Southern Berkshire Count
Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000gal. | 1,001-2,500gal. | 2,500+ gal. | Bid Value
Alford 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $  4,287.00
Becket 12,000.00 [Mirabito $ 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1429 | $ 17,148.00
Egremont 5,200.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $  7,430.80
Great Barrington 8,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 11,432.00
Monterey 8,500.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 12,146.50
Mt. Washington 4,500.00 [Mirabito S 1.429 [ $ 1.429 | $ 1429 [ $  6,430.50
Otis 8,400.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $ 12,003.60
Sheffield 6,000.00 |Mirabito $ 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 [ 8,574.00
Tyringham 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1429 | $ 1.429 | $ 1.429 | $  7,145.00
West Stockbridge 5,000.00 |Mirabito S 1.429 [ $ 1.429 | $ 1429 [ $  7,145.00
Total 65,600.00 93,742.40




FY24-16 Heating Oil




FY24-16 Option A Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 6,900.00 [Mirabito $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 3,132.60
Clarksburg 24,850.00 [Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 11,281.90
Mt. Greylock Regional School District 54,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 24,516.00
North Adams Public Schools 32,000.00 [Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 14,528.00
Williamstown 5,800.00 |Mirabito $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 2,633.20
Total 123,550.00 $ 56,091.70

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 1,362.00
Lanesborough 2,600.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 1,180.40
Pittsfield 6,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 2,724.00
Richmond 52,000.00 |Mirabito $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 23,608.00
Windsor 2,300.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 1,044.20
Total 65,900.00 $ 29,918.60

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Alford 1,200.00 |Mirabito $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 544.80
Egremont 1,800.00 [Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 817.20
Great Barrington 9,900.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 4,494.60
Lee 4,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 1,816.00
Monterey 2,800.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 1,271.20
Mt. Washington 1,500.00 [Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 681.00
Otis 3,983.00 [Mirabito $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 1,808.28
Sheffield 8,900.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 4,040.60
Tyringham 2,600.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | $ 1,180.40
West Stockbridge 9,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.454 | $ 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 4,086.00
Total 45,683.00 $ 20,740.08




FY25-16 Option B Winning Bids by Municipality

Section 1: Northern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Adams 6,900.00 [West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.620 | S 0.620 | S 0.620 | $ 4,278.00
Clarksburg 24,850.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.620 | $ 0.620 | $ 0.620 | $ 15,407.00
Mt. Greylock Regional School District 54,000.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.620 | S 0.620 | S 0.620 | $ 33,480.00
North Adams Public Schools 32,000.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.620 | $ 0.620 | $ 0.620 | $ 19,840.00
Williamstown 5,800.00 |West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.620 | S 0.620 | S 0.620 | $ 3,596.00
Total 123,550.00 $ 76,601.00

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Dalton 3,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 2,667.00
Lanesborough 2,600.00 |Mirabito S 0.889 | S 0.889 | S 0.889 | $ 2,311.40
Pittsfield 6,000.00 |Mirabito S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 5,334.00
Richmond 52,000.00 |Mirabito $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 46,228.00
Windsor 2,300.00 |Mirabito S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 2,044.70
Total 65,900.00 $ 58,585.10

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Municipality Estimated Gallons Winning Vendor 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. | Bid Value

Alford 1,200.00 |Mirabito $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 1,066.80
Egremont 1,800.00 |Mirabito 5 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 1,600.20
Great Barrington 9,900.00 |Mirabito S 0.889 | S 0.889 | S 0.889 | $ 8,801.10
Lee 4,000.00 [Mirabito S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 3,556.00
Monterey 2,800.00 |Mirabito $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 2,489.20
Mt. Washington 1,500.00 |Mirabito 5 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 1,333.50
Otis 3,983.00 [Mirabito $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 3,540.89
Sheffield 8,900.00 [Mirabito S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 7,912.10
Tyringham 2,600.00 [Mirabito $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 2,311.40
West Stockbridge 9,000.00 [Mirabito S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 8,001.00
Total 45,683.00 $ 40,612.19




FY24-16 Heating Oil

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page [Non-Collusion Form
Mirabito Yes Yes Yes
O'Connell Oil Associates, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
West Oil Company, Inc. Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: North Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2023 NYMEX Price
1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal.
Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.889 | $ 0.889 | $ 0.889
0'Connel Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.550 | $ 0.550 | $ 0.550 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. S 0.480 | $ 0.480 | $ 0.480 | S 0.620 | S 0.620 | S 0.620
Section 2: Central Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2023 NYMEX Price
1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal.
Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.889 | S 0.889 | S 0.889
O'Connel Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.550 | $ 0.550 | $ 0.550 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Section 3: Southern Berkshire County
Bidder Option A: Base Price Albany Low Posting (Date of Delivery) Option B: Fixed Price Futures/July 2023 NYMEX Price
1 - 1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal. 1-1,000 gal. 1,001 - 3,000 gal. 3,000+ gal.
Mirabito S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.454 | S 0.889 | S 0.889 | S 0.889
0'Connel Oil Associates, Inc. S 0.550 | $ 0.550 | $ 0.550 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
West Oil Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




FY24-17 Liquid Propane




FY24-17 Liquid Propane

Bidder Name Bid Signature Page Tax Compliance Page |Non-Collusion Form
Mirabito Yes Yes Yes
Superior Plus Proppane Osterman No No No
Section 1: Northern Berkshire County
Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito 39,600.00 | S 1.95|$ 77,220.00
Superior Plus Proppane Osterman 39,600.00 | Bid Incomplete Bid Incomplete

Section 2: Central Berkshire County

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito 43,000.00 | S 195 (S 83,850.00
Superior Plus Proppane Osterman 43,000.00 | Bid Incomplete Bid Incomplete

Section 3: Southern Berkshire County

Bidder Estimated Gallons Bid Price Bid Total
Mirabito 23,030.00 | S 1.95|$ 44,908.50
Superior Plus Proppane Osterman 23,030.00 | Bid Incomplete Bid Incomplete




FY24-18 Catch Basin Cleaning




FY24-18 Catch Basin Cleaning & Line Jetting

Bidder Bid Signature Page | Tax Compliance [Non-Collusion Formfment StateFHA Certificat| Bid Bond Addendum 1
REWC Land Management, Inc. Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Section 1: Catch Basin Cleaning |
) ) REWC Land Management, Inc.
Region Quantity n - -
Bid Price Bid Total
North County 72.00 | S 275.00 | S 19,800.00
Central County 349.00 | S 275.00 | $ 95,975.00
South County 318.00 | S 275.00 | $ 87,450.00
Section 2: Line Jetting |
) ) REWC Land Management, Inc.
Region Quantity n - -
Bid Price Bid Total
Central County 274.00 | S 275.00 | S 75,350.00
South County 72.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 19,800.00




FY24-19 Tree Work




FY24-18 Tree Work

Bidder

Bid Signature Page

Tax Compliance

Non-Collusion Form

rment State

HA Certificati

Bid Bond

Addendum 1

Northern Tree Service, LLC

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Section 1: North County

Service

REWC Land Management, Inc.

Hours

Bid Price Bid Total
Tree Removal 180.00 | S 355.00 | $ 63,900.00
Tree Trimming 190.00 | $ 355.00 | $ 67,450.00
Debris Removal 40.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 8,400.00
Stump Grinding 20.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 3,500.00

Section 2: Central County

Service

REWC Land Management, Inc.

Hours

Bid Price Bid Total
Tree Removal 125.00 | S 355.00 | $ 44,375.00
Tree Trimming 145.00 | S 355.00 | $ 51,475.00
Debris Removal 50.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 10,500.00

Section 3: South County

REWC Land Management, Inc.

Service Hours - - -
Bid Price Bid Total
Tree Removal 404.00 | S 355.00 | $ 143,420.00
Tree Trimming 260.00 | S 355.00 | $ 92,300.00
Debris Removal 80.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 16,800.00
Stump Grinding 10.00 | $ 175.00 | § 1,750.00
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